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Sara-Ann Wilson 

Tel: 416-863-4402 

sara.wilson@dentons.com

Lawyers for 2309522 Ontario Inc., as agent (formerly Marchant Realty 

Partners Inc., as agent) and the Receiver

AND TO: MONCUR MOWBRAY LLP 

2300 Yonge Street, Suite 1600 

Toronto, ON  M4P 1E4

Rachelle Moncur 

Tel: (416) 549-5056 

rmoncur@m2legal.ca

Independent Counsel for the Receiver

AND TO: ZEIFMAN PARTNERS INC.  

201 Bridgeland Avenue 

Toronto, ON  M6A 1Y7 

Allan Rutman

Tel: 416-256-4005 / 416-861-1487 

aar@zeifmans.ca

Roman Konovalov

RKK@zeifmans.ca

The Receiver

mailto:kenneth.kraft@dentons.com
mailto:sara.wilson@dentons.com
mailto:rmoncur@m2legal.ca
mailto:aar@zeifmans.ca
mailto:RKK@zeifmans.ca


- 2 - 

NATDOCS\50322980\V-5 

AND TO: AIRD & BERLIS LLP 

Brookfield Place 

181 Bay Street, Suite 1800 

Toronto, ON  M5J 2T9 

Steven L. Graff 

Tel: 416-865-7726 

Fax: 416-863-1515 

sgraff@airdberlis.com

Damian Lu 

dlu@airdberlis.com

Co-Counsel for the Respondents and Counsel for Charles Hunter 
Milborne

AND TO: FRIEDMANS LAW PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION 

150 Ferrand Drive, Suite 802 

Toronto, ON  M3C 3E5 

William Friedman 

Tel: 416-496-3340 ext. 199 

Fax: 416-497-3809 

wf@friedmans.ca

Stephen Nadler 

Tel: 416-496-3340 ext. 133 

SN@friedmans.ca

Co-Counsel for the Respondents and Counsel for Andrzej Kepinski 

AND TO: MINISTRY OF FINANCE

Legal Services Branch  

33 King Street West, 6th Floor 

P.O. Box 327, Stn. A 

Oshawa, ON  L1H 8H5 

Insolvency.Unit@ontario.ca

Leslie Crawford (Law Clerk) 

Leslie.Crawford@ontario.ca

mailto:sgraff@airdberlis.com
mailto:dlu@airdberlis.com
mailto:wf@friedmans.ca
mailto:SN@friedmans.ca
mailto:Insolvency.Unit@ontario.ca
mailto:Leslie.Crawford@ontario.ca


- 3 - 

NATDOCS\50322980\V-5 

AND TO: DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

Ontario Regional office

The Exchanging Tower, Box 36

130 King Street West, Suite 3400

Toronto, ON  M5X 1K6

Diane Winters 

Tel: 416-973-3172

diane.winters@justice.gc.ca

AND TO: CITY OF NIAGARA FALLS 

4310 Queen Street 

Niagara Falls, ON 

L2E 6X5 

Finance Department

legalservices@niagarafalls.ca

Anthony Scaringi  

ascaringi@niagarafalls.ca

AND TO: CANADA REVENUE AGENCY 

National Insolvency Office 

1 Front Street West 

2nd Floor, Suite 100 

Toronto, ON  M5J 2X6

D. Pesikan (Collections Officer – Insolvency) 

Tel: 905-516-0763 

Fax: 416-954-6411 

mailto:diane.winters@justice.gc.ca
mailto:legalservices@niagarafalls.ca
mailto:ascaringi@niagarafalls.ca


NATDOCS\50322980\V-5 

Email List 

kenneth.kraft@dentons.com; sara.wilson@dentons.com; rmoncur@m2legal.ca; aar@zeifmans.ca; 

RKK@zeifmans.ca; sgraff@airdberlis.com; dlu@airdberlis.com; wf@friedmans.ca; 

SN@friedmans.ca; Insolvency.Unit@ontario.ca; Leslie.Crawford@ontario.ca; 

diane.winters@justice.gc.ca; legalservices@niagarafalls.ca; ascaringi@niagarafalls.ca

mailto:kenneth.kraft@dentons.com
mailto:sara.vanallen@dentons.com
mailto:rmoncur@m2legal.ca
mailto:aar@zeifmans.ca
mailto:RKK@zeifmans.ca
mailto:sgraff@airdberlis.com
mailto:jnemers@airdberlis.com
mailto:wf@friedmans.ca
mailto:SN@friedmans.ca
mailto:Insolvency.Unit@ontario.ca
mailto:Leslie.Crawford@ontario.ca
mailto:diane.winters@justice.gc.ca
mailto:legalservices@niagarafalls.ca
mailto:ascaringi@niagarafalls.ca


INDEX



INDEX 

Tab Document Page No. 

1  Notice of Motion dated September 24, 2021 1 

2  Fourth Report of the Receiver dated September 23, 2021 12 

A  Appendix “A”: Receivership Order, dated October 14, 2020 (CV-18-
00604717-00CL) 

30 

B  Appendix “B”: Receivership Order, dated October 14, 2020 (CV-18-
00604725-00CL) 

48 

C  Appendix “C”: Receivership Order, dated October 14, 2020 (CV -18-
00604721-00CL) 

65 

D  Appendix “D”: Schedules provided by the Agent showing the amount 
advanced by each Lender for each of the three Loans 

82 

E  Appendix “E”: Interim Distribution Order of Justice Cavanagh, dated 
August 11, 2021 (CV-18-00604717-00CL) 

86 

F  Appendix “F”: Interim Distribution Order of Justice Cavanagh, dated 
August 11, 2021 (CV-18-00604725-00CL) 

91 

G  Appendix “G”: Interim Distribution Order of Justice Cavanagh, dated 
August 11, 2021 (CV -18-00604721-00CL) 

96 

H  Appendix “H”: CRA Audits of the Crystal Motel dated May 20, 2021 101 

I  Appendix “I”: Letter from the Receiver’s counsel to the CRA, dated 
September 23, 2021 (without attachments) 

107 

J  Appendix “J”: Receiver’s R&D 111 

K  Appendix “K”: Letter from Receiver’s counsel to the City of Niagara 
Falls, dated September 9, 2021 (without attachments) 

113 

L  Appendix “L”: Email from City of Toronto dated September 13, 2021 116 

M  Appendix “M”: Reply Letter from Receiver’s counsel to the City of 
Niagara Falls, dated September 21, 2021  

140 

N  Appendix “N”: Affidavit of Allan Rutman affirmed September 20, 2021 143 

O  Appendix “O”: Affidavit of Kenneth Kraft affirmed September 20, 2021 207 

P  Appendix “P”: Affidavit of Rachelle Moncur sworn September 18, 2021 265 

Q  Appendix “Q”: Affidavit of Norman Winter affirmed August 18, 2021 273 

3  Draft Discharge Order (CV-18-00604717-00CL)  289 

4  Draft Discharge Order (CV-18-00604725-00CL) 297 

5  Draft Discharge Order (CV -18-00604721-00CL) 305 



- 2 - 

Tab Document Page No. 

6  Blackline to Model Discharge Order (CV-18-00604717-00CL) 313 



Tab 1



Court File No.: CV-18-00604717-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

BETWEEN:

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

2407553 ONTARIO INC., 2384648 ONTARIO INC., 2384646 ONTARIO INC., 2400196 ONTARIO INC. 
and 2396139 ONTARIO INC. 

Respondents 

Court File No. CV-18-00604725-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

BETWEEN:

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

4267 RIVER ROAD LP and 4267 RIVER ROAD GP INC. 

Respondents 

Court File No.: CV-18-00604721-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST)

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent 

BETWEEN:

Applicant 

- and - 

4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE LP and 4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE GP INC. 

Respondents

NOTICE OF MOTION 
(returnable October 5, 2021) 
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Zeifman Partners Inc. (“Zeifman”), in its capacity as the Court-appointed receiver and 

manager (the “Receiver”) of the assets, undertakings and properties (the “Property”) of 2407553 

Ontario Inc., 2384648 Ontario Inc., 2384646 Ontario Inc., 24000196 Ontario Inc., 2396139 

Ontario Inc., 4267 River Road LP, 4267 River Road GP Inc., 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP and 

4544 Zimmerman Avenue GP Inc. (collectively, the “Debtors”), will make a motion via 

videoconference to a judge presiding over the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) 

(the “Court”) on October 5, 2021, at 11:30 a.m., or as soon after. Please refer to the conference 

details attached as Schedule “A” hereto in order to attend the motion and advise if you intend to 

join the motion by emailing amanda.campbell@dentons.com. 

PROPOSED METHOD OF HEARING: The motion is to be heard orally. 

THE MOTION IS FOR: 

1. Orders substantially in the form attached as Tabs 3, 4 and 5 to the Motion Record of the 

Receiver, dated September 24, 2021, for the following relief: 

(a) approving the Fourth Report of the Receiver, dated September 23, 2021 (“Fourth

Report”), and the activities of the Receiver as described therein;  

(b) approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver its counsel, plus estimates to 

the date of discharge, as set out in the Fourth Report and the affidavits as to fees 

filed in respect of this motion (the “Fee Affidavits”); 

(c) approving the Receiver’s statement of receipts and disbursements, for the period 

from October 14, 2021 to September 20, 2021 (the “R&D”);  

2
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(d) directing the Receiver to pay the fees and expenses, including legal expenses, of 

the Applicant and distribute to the Lenders (defined below) the remaining proceeds 

available in the estate of the Debtors in accordance with the schedules attached as 

Appendix “D” to the Fourth Report;

(e) declaring that the payment of the Applicant’s fees and expenses is without prejudice 

to the ability of the Respondents, and their principals, to challenge the propriety of 

any of the Applicant’s expenses; 

(f) authorizing the Receiver, upon the appointment of the trustee in bankruptcy in 

respect of the estates of the Debtors, to pay $19,000 per estate to the trustee to fund 

the administration of the bankruptcies; 

(g) discharging Zeifman as Receiver effective upon the filing of a certificate by the 

Receiver certifying that it has completed the activities described in the Fourth 

Report; 

(h) releasing Zeifman from any and all liability, save and except for any gross 

negligence or wilful misconduct; and  

(i) such further and other relief as counsel may request and this Honourable Court 

deems just. 
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THE GROUNDS FOR THE MOTION ARE:

Background 

1. The Applicant, as agent (the “Agent”) for consortiums of secured lenders (the “Lenders”), 

commenced three companion receivership applications seeking the appointment of the 

Receiver. 

2. The Receiver was appointed pursuant to three Orders of the Honourable Justice Gilmore, 

dated August 6, 2020 (the “Receivership Orders”).  Pursuant to Her Honour’s 

Endorsement, dated August 6, 2020, the Receivership Orders were stayed until October 

14, 2020, to provide the Debtors with additional time to repay the indebtedness owing to 

the Lenders. 

3. The indebtedness was not repaid, and the Receivership Orders became effective on October 

14, 2020. 

4. The Property was primarily comprised of six (6) real properties (the “Real Properties”) 

located in downtown Niagara Falls, Ontario. 

Final Distribution 

5. Pursuant to the Approval and Vesting Orders of the Honourable Justice Cavanagh, dated 

June 24, 2021, the Court approved the Agreement of Purchase and Sale, dated May 26, 

2021 (the “Purchase Agreement”), and the sale of Real Properties en bloc.  The sale 

transaction closed on July 5, 2021. 

6. The obligations of the Debtors to the Lenders were secured by mortgages (the 

“Mortgages”) registered against the Real Properties: 

4
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Real Property Mortgage 
Registration Date 

Mortgage Principal 
Amount 

4249-4267 River Road October 23, 2013 $2,945,000

(“4267 River Road 
Mortgage”)

4299 Queen Street 

4551 Zimmerman Avenue 

4100 Bridge Street 

4122 Bridge Street & 4538 Cataract 
Avenue 

March 13, 2014 $7,000,000

4544 & 4552 Zimmerman Avenue December 2, 2014 $5,500,000

Total $15,445,000

7. The Debtors also executed and delivered security agreements in favour of the Agent, and 

the Agent registered against each of the Debtors pursuant to the Personal Property Security 

Act (Ontario) over all collateral classifications, except “consumer goods”.  

8. Pursuant to the Orders of the Honourable Justice Cavanagh, dated August 11, 2021 (the 

“Interim Distribution Orders”), the Receiver paid the Agent’s expenses (including legal 

fees) and made interim distributions to all of the Lenders. 

9. As of September 20, 2021, after the interim distribution noted above, the Debtors are 

indebted to the Lenders in the following amounts: 

5
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Court File No. Debtors Real Properties Indebtedness   
(as of September 
20, 2021)*

CV-18-
00604725-00CL 

4267 River Road LP  
4267 River Road GP Inc.  

(together, “4267 River Road”) 

4249/4267 River 
Road  

$1,178,002.52

CV-18-
00604717-00CL 

2407553 Ontario Inc. 

2384648 Ontario Inc. 2384646 

Ontario Inc. 2400196 Ontario Inc. 

2396139 Ontario Inc. 

4100 Bridge Street  

4122 Bridge Street & 
4538 Cataract Ave 
4299 Queen Street 
4551 Zimmerman 

Avenue

$4,610,386.10

CV-18-
00604721-00CL 

4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP 
4544 Zimmerman Avenue GP Inc. 

(together, “4544 Zimmerman”) 

4544 & 4552 
Zimmerman Ave  

$4,103,708.27 

* not including unpaid costs and Agent’s legal fees

10. Canada Revenue Agency (“CRA”) conducted audits in respect of 4267 River Road and 

assessed GST/HST owing as follows: 

Debtor Period GST/HST 
Outstanding 

GST/HST Assessed 
(including penalties 

and interest)

4267 River Road LP 2019 $23,714.88

2018 $16,558.86

4267 River Road GP Inc. 2018 $4,291.99

11. CRA did not assess any amounts owing by 4267 River Road (owner of the Crystal Inn) for 

source deductions.   

12. CRA is in the process of conducting an audit of 4544 Zimmerman and it is unknown when 

the audit will be complete. The Real Property has been unoccupied since at least 2017 and, 

as such, the Receiver does not expect any GST/HST to be assessed. 

13. The CRA has not assessed any GST/HST or other amounts owing by the other Debtors; 

6
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14. The monies held by the Receiver for distribution are proceeds from the sale of the Real 

Properties. 

15. The 4267 River Road Mortgage, which was registered in 2013, pre-dates 4267 River 

Road’s GST/HST liability, which arose in 2018 and 2019.  Accordingly, pursuant to 

Section 222(4) of the Excise Tax Act (Canada) and related regulations, the Mortgage 

constitutes a “prescribed security interest” and any deemed trust in favour of the CRA in 

respect of 4267 River Road’s GST/HST liability ranks subsequent to the 4267 River Road 

Mortgage. 

16. By letter dated, September 23, 2021, counsel to the Receiver wrote to the CRA advising of 

the proposed final distribution to the Lenders, in priority to any claim of the CRA. The 

Receiver’s counsel provided a deadline of twelve (12) weeks from the date of the letter for 

the CRA to respond or object to the proposed distribution. 

17. The Receiver recommends approving a final distribution of the net proceeds of the Real 

Properties to the Lenders, after payment of the fees and expenses of the Agent, which form 

a priority obligation under the loan agreements.  The Receiver undertakes not to distribute 

any monies to the Lenders until the expiry of the twelve (12) week period noted above, or 

confirmation from CRA that it does not object to the distribution to the Lenders. 

18. The Receiver will not distribute any monies to the Lenders to 4544 Zimmerman until the 

CRA audit is complete, or such Debtors are adjudged bankrupt.  

19. Each Lender will receive a percentage of the net proceeds available for distribution for 

each Loan equal to the percentage of the principal amount of the Loans each Lender 

7
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originally advanced.  The schedules showing the Lenders’ respective entitlements are 

attached to the draft Orders and Appendix “D” to the Fourth Report. 

20. The proceeds available for distribution to the Lenders are far less than the indebtedness 

owing under each of the Loans and the Lenders are expected to suffer substantial shortfalls.  

After distributions to the Lenders, there will be no funds available for distribution to any 

subsequent ranking creditors, including the CRA. 

Fees and R&D 

21. As detailed in the Fourth Report and the Fee Affidavits, the Receiver has worked diligently 

to carry out its duties in good faith and in the best interest of the Debtors’ stakeholders. 

22. Pursuant to the Receivership Order, the Receiver and its counsel shall be paid their 

reasonable fees and disbursements and shall pass their accounts before this Court. 

23. The Receiver’s fees and those of its counsel are detailed in the Fourth Report and the Fee 

Affidavits filed in respect of this motion. 

24. The R&D is attached as Appendix “J” to the Fourth Report.  

Discharge and Release 

25. Upon the completion of the remaining activities described in the Fourth Report, the 

administration of the Debtors’ estates will be substantially completed and the conditional 

discharge of the Receiver is appropriate at this time. 

26. The Receiver has duly and properly discharged its duties, responsibilities and obligations 

as Receiver.  

8
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Other Grounds

27. Section 243 of the BIA. 

28. Section 222 of the Excise Tax Act (Canada) and Regulation 2011-55. 

29. Rules 1.04, 2.03, 3.02, 16.08 and 37 of the Rules of Civil Procedure (Ontario). 

30. Such further and other grounds as counsel may advise and this Court may permit. 

THE FOLLOWING DOCUMENTARY EVIDENCE WILL BE USED AT THE HEARING 
OF THE MOTION:  

1. The Third Report of the Receiver, dated July 29, 2021; 

2. The Fourth Report; dated September 23, 2021 

3. The Fee Affidavits; and 

4. Such further and other material as counsel may advise and this Court may permit.  

DATE:  September 24, 2021 MONCUR MOWBRAY LLP 

2300 Yonge Street, Suite 1600 

Toronto, ON  M4P 1E4

Rachelle Moncur (LSO # 45474I) 

Tel: (416) 549-5056 

rmoncur@m2legal.ca

Independent Counsel for the Receiver

TO: SERVICE LIST 

9
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Schedule “A” 
Conference Details to join Motion via Zoom 

Join Zoom Meeting 
https://dentons.zoom.us/j/95449837753?pwd=VExqTVQ1QmNTYnVUQitxY2xVWmpadz09

Meeting ID: 954 4983 7753 
Passcode: 203702 

Dial by your location 
        +1 778 907 2071 Canada 
        +1 613 209 3054 Canada 
        +1 647 558 0588 Canada 
        855 703 8985 Canada Toll-free

10
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Court File No.: CV-18-00604717-00CL 

ONTARIO

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

BETWEEN:

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

2407553 ONTARIO INC., 2384648 ONTARIO INC., 2384646 ONTARIO INC., 2400196 ONTARIO INC. 

and 2396139 ONTARIO INC. 

Respondents 

Court File No. CV-18-00604725-00CL 

ONTARIO

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

BETWEEN:

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

4267 RIVER ROAD LP and 4267 RIVER ROAD GP INC. 

Respondents 

Court File No.: CV-18-00604721-00CL 

ONTARIO

SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

BETWEEN:

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE LP and 4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE GP INC. 

Respondents 

FOURTH REPORT OF THE RECEIVER  

September 23, 2021
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O  Affidavit of Kenneth Kraft, affirmed September 20, 2021 

P  Affidavit of Rachelle Moncur, sworn September 18, 2021 

Q  Affidavit of Norman Winter, sworn August 18, 2021 
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INTRODUCTION 

1. Pursuant to Orders of the Honourable Justice Gilmore of the Ontario Superior Court of 

Justice (Commercial List) (the “Court”), dated August 6, 2020 (the “Receivership 

Orders”), issued in three separate receivership applications, Zeifman Partners Inc. 

(“Zeifman”) was appointed as receiver and manager (the “Receiver”) without security, of 

all of the assets, undertakings and properties (the “Property”) of the following related 

entities (collectively the “Debtors”): 

(a) 2407553 Ontario Inc., 2384648 Ontario Inc., 2384646 Ontario Inc., 2400196 

Ontario Inc. and 2396139 Ontario Inc.; 

(b) 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, 4544 Zimmerman Avenue GP Inc.; and 

(c) 4267 River Road LP and 4267 River Road GP Inc. 

2. Pursuant to Justice Gilmore’s Endorsement, dated August 6, 2020, the Receivership Orders 

were stayed until October 14, 2020, to provide the Debtors will additional time to repay 

the indebtedness owing to the Applicant, as agent.  The indebtedness was not repaid, and 

the Receivership Orders became effective on October 14, 2020. Copies of the Receivership 

Orders are attached hereto as Appendices “A”, “B” and “C”.   

PURPOSE OF THE REPORT 

3. The purpose of this Fourth Report of the Receiver (the “Fourth Report”) is to report to 

the Court on the Receiver’s activities since the Third Report of the Receiver, dated July 29, 

2021 (the “Third Report”), and seek Orders: 

(a) approving this Fourth Report of the Receiver and the activities of the Receiver as 

described herein;  

(b) approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel, plus estimates 

to the date of discharge, as set out in this Fourth Report and the affidavits as to fees 

filed in respect of the Receiver’s motion;  
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(c) approving the Receiver’s statement of receipts and disbursements, for the period 

from from October 14, 2021 to September 20, 2021 (the “R&D”);  

(d) directing the Receiver to pay the fees and expenses, including legal expenses, of 

the Applicant and distribute to the Lenders (defined below) the remaining proceeds 

available in the estate of the Debtors in accordance with the schedules attached 

hereto as Appendix “D”; 

(e) declaring that the payment of the Applicant’s fees and expenses is without prejudice 

to the ability of the Respondents, and their principals, to challenge the propriety of 

any of the Applicant’s expenses; 

(f) authorizing the Receiver, upon the appointment of the trustee in bankruptcy in 

respect of the estates of the Debtors, to pay $19,000 per estate to the trustee to fund 

the administration of the bankruptcies; 

(g) discharging Zeifman as Receiver of the Property of the Debtors effective upon the 

filing of a certificate by the Receiver certifying that it has completed the activities 

described in this Fourth Report; and 

(h) releasing Zeifman from any and all liability, save and except for any gross 

negligence or wilful misconduct. 

TERMS OF REFERENCE 

4. In preparing this Fourth Report, the Receiver has been provided with, and has relied upon 

unaudited, draft and/or internal financial information, the Debtors’ books and records, 

discussions with employees and information from third-party sources (collectively, the 

“Information”).  Except as described in this Fourth Report: 
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(a) the Receiver has reviewed the Information for reasonableness, internal consistency 

and use in the context in which it was provided.  However, the Receiver has not 

audited or otherwise attempted to verify the accuracy or completeness of the 

Information in a manner that would wholly or partially comply with Canadian 

Auditing Standards (“CAS”) pursuant to the Chartered Professional Accountants 

Canada Handbook and, accordingly, the Receiver expresses no opinion or other 

form of assurance contemplated under CAS in respect of the Information; and 

(b) the Receiver has prepared this Fourth Report in connection with the discharge of 

the Receiver’s duties and responsibilities pursuant to the Receivership Orders and 

under statute and in support of the relief described herein.  Parties using the Fourth 

Report, other than for the purposes outlined herein, are cautioned that it may not be 

appropriate for their purposes. 

5. Unless otherwise stated, all dollar amounts contained in the Fourth Report are expressed 

in Canadian dollars. 

BACKGROUND 

6. Marchant Realty Partners Inc. (the “Agent”)1, in its capacity as agent in respect of three 

distinct loan facilities (the “Loans”), commenced three separate companion receivership 

applications.   

7. Although the Loans were advanced at different times, their terms are substantially similar.  

They were advanced to the Debtors by groups of lenders (the “Lenders”) comprised of 

various individuals and corporations. The principals/personal guarantors behind each of 

the Debtors are the same two individuals, Charles Hunter Milborne (“Milborne”) and 

Andrzej Roman Kepinski (“Kepinski”).  Attached hereto as Appendix “D” are schedules 

provided by the Agent showing the amount advanced by each Lender for each of the three 

Loans.  

1 Marchant recently changed its corporate name to 2309522 Ontario Inc. 
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8. The Loans were secured by general security agreements and mortgages over the following 

real properties located in Niagara Falls, Ontario (collectively, the “Real Properties”):  

(a) 4249-4267 River Road;  

(b) 4299 Queen Street; 

(c) 4551 Zimmerman Avenue; 

(d) 4100 Bridge Street; 

(e) 4122 Bridge Street & 4538 Cataract Avenue; and   

(f) 4544 & 4552 Zimmerman Avenue. 

9. The Real Properties consist of various mixed-use commercial properties, a seasonal 

operating motel (currently closed due to Covid-19), and vacant land.    

10. Each of the Loans matured and, when the indebtedness remained outstanding after 

demands for repayment, the Agent commenced the within receivership applications. 

Pursuant to the Receivership Orders, the Receiver was appointed in respect of the Property, 

including the Real Properties. 

11. Pursuant to the Approval and Vesting Orders of the Honourable Justice Cavanagh, dated 

June 24, 2021 (the “Approval and Vesting Orders”), the Court approved the Agreement 

of Purchase and Sale, dated May 26, 2021 (the “Purchase Agreement”), between the 

Receiver and 2831949 Ontario Inc. and the sale of the Real Properties en bloc (the 

“Transaction”). The Transaction closed on July 5, 2021.  Copies of the Purchase 

Agreement and Approval and Vesting Orders were appended to the Third Report, 

previously filed.   

RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES  

12. The activities of the Receiver since the date of the Third Report included: 

(a) attending Court to seek the Interim Distribution Orders (defined below); 
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(b) paying the Agent’s expenses, including legal fees, and making interim distributions 

to the Lenders; 

(c) corresponding with the City of Niagara Falls regarding the costs of clean up at 4538 

Cataract Avenue which was destroyed by fire prior to the receivership; 

(d) instructing counsel with respect to writing to the City of Niagara Falls regarding 

obtaining particulars of the above-noted clean up costs and reviewing the 

documentation received from the City of Niagara Falls; 

(e) corresponding with counsel to the Lenders regarding the bankruptcy applications; 

and 

(f) drafting this Fourth Report.  

FINAL DISTRIBUTION 

13. Pursuant to three separate Loan Agreements, the Lenders advanced three non-revolving 

term loans to the Debtors.  The loans were secured by mortgages (the “Mortgages”) 

registered against the Real Properties and security agreements registered pursuant to the 

pursuant to the Personal Property Security Act (Ontario) (“PPSA”).  Copies of the loan 

and security documents, including the Mortgages, Real Property parcel registers and PPSA 

searches were appended to the Third Report, previously filed.   

14. Until the Transaction closed, the only mortgages registered against the Real Properties 

were in favour of the Agent.  The only PPSA registrations against the Debtors are in favour 

of the Agent.   

15. The Receiver obtained opinions from independent counsel which opined that the 

Mortgages were validly registered and the Agent’s security in respect of the Debtors’ 

personal property is valid and enforceable.   

16. The Approval and Vesting Orders ordered that the Mortgages be discharged from title to 

the Real Properties. However, each of the Approval and Vesting Orders have the standard 

language preserving the priority to the sale proceeds as follows:  
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THIS COURT ORDERS that for the purposes of determining the 

nature and priority of Claims, the net proceeds from the sale of the 

Purchased Assets shall stand in the place and stead of the Purchased 

Assets, and that from and after the delivery of the Receiver's 

Certificate all Claims and Encumbrances shall attach to the net 

proceeds from the sale of the Purchased Assets with the same 

priority as they had with respect to the Purchased Assets 

immediately prior to the sale, as if the Purchased Assets had not been 

sold and remained in the possession or control of the Receiver 

having that possession or control immediately prior to the sale. 

17. Pursuant to the Orders of the Honourable Justice Cavanagh, dated August 11, 2021 (the 

“Interim Distribution Orders”), the Receiver paid the Agent’s expenses (including legal 

fees) and made interim distributions to each of the Lenders.  Copies of the Interim 

Distribution Orders are attached hereto as Appendices “E”, “F” and “G”. 

18. As of September 20, 2021, after the interim distribution noted above, the Agent advises 

that the Debtors are indebted to the Lenders in the following amounts:  

Court File No. Debtors Real Properties Indebtedness   
(as of September 
20, 2021, not 
including unpaid 
costs and Agent’s 
legal fees)

CV-18-
00604725-00CL 

4267 River Road LP  

4267 River Road GP Inc.  

(together “4267 River Road”) 

4249/4267 River Road  $1,178,002.52

CV-18-
00604717-00CL 

2407553 Ontario Inc. 

2384648 Ontario Inc. 2384646 
Ontario Inc. 2400196 Ontario Inc. 
2396139 Ontario Inc. 

4100 Bridge Street  

4122 Bridge Street & 
4538 Cataract Ave 

4299 Queen Street 

4551 Zimmerman 
Avenue 

$4,610,386.10

CV-18-
00604721-00CL 

4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP 

4544 Zimmerman Avenue GP Inc.  
(together, “4544 Zimmerman”) 

4544 & 4552 Zimmerman 
Ave  

$4,103,708.27 
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Priority Payables 

19. Canada Revenue Agency (“CRA”) conducted audits in respect of 4267 River Road and 

assessed HST owing as follows: 

Debtor Period HST 

Outstanding 

HST Assessed 

(including penalties 

and interest)

4267 River Road LP 2019 $23,714.88

2018 $16,558.86

4267 River Road GP Inc. 2018 $4,291.99

20. CRA did not assess any amounts owing in respect of source deductions by 4267 River 

Road (owner of the Crystal Inn).  Copies of the letters from CRA, dated May 20, 2021, are 

attached hereto as Appendix “H”.

21. CRA is in the process of conducting an audit of 4544 Zimmerman and it is unknown when 

the audit will be complete. The Real Property has been unoccupied since at least 2017 and, 

as such, the Receiver does not expect any GST/HST to be assessed.    

22. It is unclear at this time if the CRA will conduct an audit of 2396139 Ontario Inc. in respect 

of the rental income from 4551 Zimmerman Avenue.  

23. As of the date of this Fourth Report, the CRA has not assessed any GST/HST or other 

amounts owing by the other Debtors. 

24. The Receiver’s counsel advises that 4267 River Road’s GST/HST liability ranks 

subsequent to the Mortgages.  Additional details in respect of this issue are set out below. 

Proposed Distribution to Lenders 

25. The Mortgages in favour of the Lenders were registered in 2013 and 2014: 
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Real Property Mortgage 
Registration Date 

Mortgage Principal 
Amount 

4249-4267 River Road (Crystal Inn) October 23, 2013 $2,945,000

4299 Queen Street 

4551 Zimmerman Avenue 

4100 Bridge Street 

4122 Bridge Street & 4538 Cataract 
Avenue 

March 13, 2014 $7,000,000

4544 & 4552 Zimmerman Avenue December 2, 2014 $5,500,000

Total $15,445,000

26. 4267 River Road’s GST/HST liability arose in 2018 and 2019, which is subsequent to the 

registration of the Mortgages.   

27. The remaining monies the Receiver holds for distribution are proceeds from the sale of the 

Real Properties.  The Real Properties are commercial properties that, except the Crystal 

Inn, were leased or vacant.  With respect to the Crystal Inn, upon the Receiver’s 

appointment, it assessed the state of the property and determined that the property was in 

very poor condition and could not be operated without a substantial investment in 

renovations and the purchase of all new furnishings. The Receiver estimates that any 

personal property located at the Crystal Inn had nominal value.  Furthermore, Schedule 

“E” of the Purchase Agreement allocates the Purchase Price (as defined therein) amongst 

the Real Properties.  No portion of the Purchase Price was allocated to personal property.   

28. The Receiver did not take possession of any other Property and, accordingly, all proceeds 

held by the Receiver arose as a result of the enforcement of the Mortgages.  

29. The Receiver heldback approximately $200,000 in each estate from the interim 

distributions to cover the estimated costs to complete the administration of the 

receiverships and the Debtors’ estimated potential GST/HST liabilities in the event that 

CRA successfully objects to the distribution to the Lenders in priority to CRA.  
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30. By letter dated September 23, 2021, independent counsel to the Receiver wrote to the CRA 

advising of the proposed distribution of all net remaining proceeds to the Lenders, after 

payment of fees and expenses, in priority to any claim of the CRA.  The Receiver’s counsel 

provided a deadline of twelve (12) weeks from the date of the letter for the CRA to respond 

or object to the proposed distribution.  A copy of the letter from the Receiver’s counsel to 

the CRA, dated September 23, 2021 is attached hereto as Appendix “I”.   

31. The Receiver undertakes not to distribute the remaining net proceeds to the Lenders prior 

to the expiry of the twelve (12) week deadline.  In the event that the CRA does not respond, 

or does not otherwise object to the proposed distribution, after the expiry of the twelve (12) 

week period, the Receiver will proceed with the final distribution to the Lenders and file 

its discharge certificate. If the CRA confirms it is in agreement with the proposed 

distribution to the Lenders in priority to the CRA, the Receiver will proceed with the final 

distribution and file its discharge certificate upon the completion of any other outstanding 

matters in the administration of the estates.  

32. With respect to 4544 Zimmerman, due to the outstanding CRA audit, the Receiver will not 

make any final distribution to the 4544 Zimmerman Lenders until the CRA audit is 

complete or such Debtors are adjudged bankrupt.  

33. Given that the proceeds arise from Mortgages that long predate any potential GST/HST 

arrears, and the Lenders have indicated they intend to bring bankruptcy applications against 

certain of the Debtors, the Receiver does not believe that CRA will need an extended period 

of time to determine its legal position even if additional potential GST/HST amounts are 

owed.  

34. Accordingly, the Receiver recommends approving a final distribution of the net proceeds 

of the Real Properties to the Lenders, after payment of the fees and expenses of the Agent.  

The Agent advises that it has incurred expenses and under the loan agreements such 

expenses are to be paid in priority to any distributions to the Lenders.  
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35. Each Lender will receive a percentage of the net proceeds available for distribution for 

each Loan equal to the percentage of the principal amount of the Loans each Lender 

originally advanced. 

36. As set out in the Receiver’s R&D, the proceeds available for distribution to the Lenders 

are far less than the indebtedness owing under each of the Loans and the Lenders are 

expected to suffer substantial shortfalls.  After distributions to the Lenders, there will be 

no funds available for distribution to any subsequent ranking creditors, including the CRA. 

INTERCOMPANY CLAIMS  

37. The Receiver obtained certain of the Debtors’ banking records and conducted a detailed 

review of the records.  The records showed that funds flowed from the accounts of the 

borrowers (the “Borrowers”) for each of the Loans to certain related companies.  The 

Borrowers’ accounting records confirmed that the related companies are indebted to the 

Borrowers.  A summary of the indebtedness owed to the Borrowers by the related 

companies, as contained in the Borrowers’ records, is set out below: 

Related Company Borrower Indebtedness 
(CAD) 

Niagara Global Developments 
Ltd. 

4267 River Road LP $50,000.00 

4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP $107,850.00 

2407553 Ontario Inc. $175,000.00 

Prestantia Management Group 
Limited 

4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP $100,000.00 

4049 River Road LP and 4049 
River Road GP Inc. 

4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP $1,007,304.00 

2407553 Ontario Inc. $2,398,728.00 

1021862 Ontario Ltd. 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP $448,674.00 

4267 River Road LP $510,385.22 

Total $4,797,941.22 

38. As previously reported, by letters dated, March 15, 2021, the Receiver wrote to each of the 

related companies and demanded the immediate repayment of the indebtedness owing to 
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the Borrowers.  No response was received to the Receiver’s letters.  Copies of the 

Receiver’s letters are were attached to the Third Report.   

39. The Receiver was advised by counsel to the Agent that the Lenders will file bankruptcy 

applications against each of the Borrowers.  The Receiver understands the Lenders intend 

to bring a motion pursuant to s. 38 of the Bankruptcy and Insolvency Act (Canada) to seek 

the assignment of the actions against the Borrowers in respect of the intercompany 

indebtedness.   

RECEIPTS & DISBURSEMENTS 

40. Attached hereto as Appendix “J” is a copy of the Receiver’s R&D, for the period between 

from October 14, 2021 to September 20, 2021, for each of the three receivership 

proceedings.   

CATARACT CLEAN UP COSTS 

41. As previously reported to the Court, the Receiver is in the process of investigating the 

quantum of costs charged by the City of Niagara Falls to clean up the 4538 Cataract 

Avenue after the building was destroyed by a fire.  The clean up work was completed 

prior to the Receiver’s appointment.  The total amount charged by the City of Niagara 

Falls was $65,965.34 and was added to the property tax account.  Upon the sale of the 

4538 Cataract Avenue property, the Receiver paid the total amount of the invoice, under 

protest, in order to provide clear title to the Purchaser.   

42. The Receiver contacted representatives of the City of Niagara Falls to request particulars 

of the quantum of clean up charges, however the City of Niagara Falls refused to provide 

same.  By letter, dated September 9, 2021, the Receiver’s counsel wrote to the City of 

Niagara Falls requesting particulars and documentation supporting the $65,965.34 charges.  

A copy of the letter from Receiver’s counsel, dated September 9, 2021 (without 

attachments), is attached hereto as Appendix “K”.  

43. By email, dated September 13, 2021, the City of Niagara Falls responding providing 

supporting documentation in respect of the clean up costs.  Copies of the email and 

documentation from the City of Niagara Falls is attached hereto as Appendix “L”. The 
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Receiver reviewed same and noted that certain documentation requested was not provided.  

By letter, dated September 21, 2021, counsel to the Receiver wrote to the City of Niagara 

Falls requesting the missing documentation.  A copy of the letter from the Receiver’s 

counsel, dated September 21, 2021, is attached hereto as Appendix “M”.

REMAINING ACTIVITIES 

44. The remaining activities of the Receiver, which must be completed before the filing of the 

Receiver’s discharge certificate include: 

(a) paying the Agent’s fees and expenses; 

(b) paying all accrued and unpaid fees of the Receiver and its counsel; 

(c) reviewing additional documentation in respect of the 4538 Cataract Avenue clean 

up costs, to be provided by the City of Niagara Falls, and corresponding with the 

City of Niagara Falls regarding same; 

(d) receive and review the CRA audit in respect of 4544 Zimmerman; 

(e) making a final distribution of the monies in its hands to the Lenders, as set out 

herein; and 

(f) filing its final report and final statement of receipts and disbursements with the 

Office of the Superintendent of Bankruptcy. 

45. Upon completion of the above-described activities, the administration of the Debtors’ 

estates will be substantially completed and the conditional discharge of the Receiver is 

appropriate at this time. 

46. The Receiver has duly and properly discharged its duties, responsibilities and obligations 

as Receiver.  

PROFESSIONAL FEES 

47. The Receiver seeks approval of its fees and disbursements, those of its legal counsel, 

Dentons Canada LLP (“Dentons”), and those of its independent legal counsel.   
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48. The Receiver and Dentons maintained separate accounts for each of the three receivership 

proceedings.  The Receiver’s independent counsel apportioned their accounts amongst the 

three proceedings. 

49. The fees and disbursements of the Receiver and Dentons from the date of the Receiver’s 

appointment to May 31, 2021 were previously approved pursuant to Orders of the Court.  

The Receiver has reviewed the fees and expenses of its counsel and it is of the view that 

such fees and expenses are reasonable and validly incurred.   

Receiver’s Fees 

50. Below is a summary of the Receiver’s fees and disbursements for the period from June 1, 

2021, to September 15, 2021: 

Court File No. Fees Disbursements HST Total 

CV-18-00604717-00CL $26,867.50 $101.69 $3,505.99 $30,475.18

CV-18-00604725-00CL $27,111.25 $101.67 $3,537.68 $30,750.60

CV-18-00604721-00CL $27,225.00 $101.67 $3,552.47 $30,879.14

51. The fees and disbursements of the Receiver are more particularly described in the Affidavit 

of Allan Rutman, affirmed September 20, 2021, attached hereto as Appendix “N”. 

Dentons’ Fees 

52. Dentons has acted as counsel to the Receiver since its appointment.  Below is a summary 

of Dentons’ fees and disbursements for the period from June 1, 2021, to September 15, 

2021:   

Court File No. Fees Disbursements HST Total 

CV-18-00604717-00CL $36,930.50 $1,740.19 $4,943.99 $43,614.68

CV-18-00604725-00CL $36,268.50 $870.25 $4,744.44 $41,883.59

CV-18-00604721-00CL $35,702.50 $1,213.58 $4,715.90 $41,631.98

53. The fees and disbursements of Dentons are more particularly described in the Affidavit of 

Kenneth Kraft, affirmed September 20, 2021, attached hereto as Appendix “O”. 
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Independent Counsel’s Fees 

54. Moncur Mowbray LLP (“MM LLP”) acted as independent counsel to the Receiver.  Below 

is a summary of MM LP’s fees and disbursements for the period from June 1, 2021, to 

August 11, 2021:

Court File No. Fees Disbursements HST Total 

CV-18-00604717-00CL $3,330.00 $0.00 $432.90 $3,762.90

CV-18-00604725-00CL $3,330.00 $0.00 $432.90 $3,762.90

CV-18-00604721-00CL $3,330.00 $0.00 $432.90 $3,762.90

55. The fees and disbursements of MM LLP are more particularly described in the Affidavit 

of Rachelle Moncur, sworn September 18, 2021, attached hereto as Appendix “P”. 

56. N. H. Winter Law, Professional Corporation (“NHW Law”) acted as independent real 

estate counsel to the Receiver.  Winter Law review the Agent’s real property security and 

issued an opinion to the Receiver in respect of same.  Below is a summary of NWH Law’s 

fees and disbursements for the period from June 1, 2021, to July 23, 2021:

Court File No. Fees Disbursements HST Total 

CV-18-00604717-00CL $2,828.00 $327.18 $389.64 $3,554.82

CV-18-00604725-00CL $1,892.00 $151.09 $257.70 $2,300.88

CV-18-00604721-00CL $1,892.00 $117.80 $254.78 $2,264.58

57. The fees and disbursements of Winter Law are more particularly described in the Affidavit 

of Norman Winter, affirmed August 18, 2021, attached hereto as Appendix “Q”. 

RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE RECEIVER 

58. Based on the foregoing, the Receiver respectfully recommends that the Court make an 

order granting the relief as set out in its Notice of Motion, September 24, 2021. 
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All of the foregoing is respectfully submitted this 23rd day of September, 2021.

ZEIFMAN PARTNERS INC., in its capacity as

Receiver and Manager of 2407553 Ontario Inc., 2384648

Ontario Inc., 2384646 Ontario Inc., 2400196 Ontario Inc.

and 2396139 Ontario Inc., 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP,

4544 Zimmerman Avenue GP Inc, 4267 River Road LP

and 4267 River Road GP Inc

corporate capacity f

ind not in its personal or

Per:

Name:

Title:

Allan Rutman

President
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2407553 Ontario Inc. (Court File No.: CV-18-00604717-00CL)

Lender Original Loan Amount Percentage of Loan

1 SRnED Limited (Earl Viner) 100,000.00 1.4286%

2 Lakes Holdings Ltd. (Earl Viner) 350,000.00 5.0000%

3 Marni Feingold (Earl Viner's niece) 50,000.00 0.7143%

4 Marjan Misiurak Holdings Inc. 100,000.00 1.4286%

5 JLL Developments Inc. 200,000.00 2.8571%

6 Susanna and Sheldon Kwok 300,000.00 4.2857%

7 Stephen Kwok Professional Corporation 350,000.00 5.0000%

8 Hilary and Lan Ma 200,000.00 2.8571%

9 Mark and Julia Wong 200,000.00 2.8571%

10 Edith Lau 50,000.00 0.7143%

11 ESTS Incorporated (Wilma Ieong) 100,000.00 1.4286%

12 Raymond Yeung 100,000.00 1.4286%

13 Dr. Ian Lo Dentistry Professional Corporation 100,000.00 1.4286%

14 995820 Ontario Inc. c/o Tammy Lee 100,000.00 1.4286%

15 2174912 Ontario Inc. c/o Michael Wong 200,000.00 2.8571%

16 Dr. William Chiu Dentistry Professional Corporation             300,000.00 4.2857%

17 Dr. Bryan Chan Dentistry Professional Corporation               150,000.00 2.1429%

18 Dr. Bernard Y.T. Li Medicine Professional Corporation          100,000.00 1.4286%

19 Dr. Wing K. Tse Medicine Professional Corporation               100,000.00 1.4286%

20 Dr. Dakin Lee Dentistry Professional Corporation                   100,000.00 1.4286%

21 Dr. Hoppy Hui Dentistry Professional Corporation                  150,000.00 2.1429%

22 Eddie Siek-Hin Leung 100,000.00 1.4286%

23 John Francis Footprints Limited 500,000.00 7.1429%

24 1862199 Ontario Inc.( ASO Sandie Murphy) 100,000.00 1.4286%

25 Frank DiMarco In Trust (formerly Alfredo & Maria DiMarco) 500,000.00 7.1429%

26 1599732 Ontario Limited( ASO: Randy Miller) 200,000.00 2.8571%

27 2083294 Ontario Inc. ( ASO: Antonio Baretto) 200,000.00 2.8571%

28 Michael Longo, Riccardo Carnevale, Daniele Carnevale 215,000.00 3.0714%

29 Riccardo Carnevale 130,000.00 1.8571%

30 Daniele Carnevale 125,000.00 1.7857%

31 Lindwall Holdings Inc. 270,000.00 3.8571%

32 2331144 Ontario Ltd (ASO: Beata Grygowski) 100,000.00 1.4286%

33 Leslaw and Danuta Wojtanowski 100,000.00 1.4286%

34 MLC Financial Ltd. (ASO: Mark Curtis) 100,000.00 1.4286%

35 Fox Realty Corp. 50,000.00 0.7143%

36 MCL Communications Ltd.(c/o Mr. Kim Lockhart) 200,000.00 2.8571%

37 Nadir Janmohammed 200,000.00 2.8571%

38 David Goncalves (formerly Walji) 200,000.00 2.8571%

39 Faiza Kassam and Nazir Kassam 75,000.00 1.0714%

40 Sabrina Kassam and Rizwan Mohamed 35,000.00 0.5000%

41 Karim Naser 100,000.00 1.4286%

42 Remco Holdings Inc 100,000.00 1.4286%

Total 7,000,000.00$                               100.0000%
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4267 River Road LP (Court File No.: CV-18-00604725-00CL)

Lender Original Loan Amount Percentage of Loan

1 Faiza & Nazir Kassam 200,000.00 6.7912%

2 485 Kingston Road Limited (Svetlana Dimitroff) 460,000.00 15.6197%

3 Dr. Svetlana Dimitroff 260,000.00 8.8285%

4 Daveni Investments Ltd. (Earl Viner) 200,000.00 6.7912%

5 Campana Consulting 100,000.00 3.3956%

6 Jack Shinehoft Professional Corporation 50,000.00 1.6978%

7 Senol & Fatima Tasdelin 300,000.00 10.1868%

8 Remco Holdings 25,000.00 0.8489%

9 Onally & Sofia Rahemtulla 75,000.00 2.5467%

10 Rose Consultants Limited (Bryan Pilutti) 200,000.00 6.7912%

11 Tony Lee 150,000.00 5.0934%

12 Willis Qu 150,000.00 5.0934%

13 Stephen & Susanna Kwok 100,000.00 3.3956%

14 1221455 Ontario Limited (Kwok) 100,000.00 3.3956%

15 Wilma Ieong Professional Corporation 100,000.00 3.3956%

16 Ditchburn Consulting Inc. (Tony Ditchburn) 75,000.00 2.5467%

17 Edith Lai Yuk Chiu 100,000.00 3.3956%

18 Mark & Julia Wong 100,000.00 3.3956%

19 Raymond Yeung 100,000.00 3.3956%

20 Dr Ian Lo Dentistry Proffessional Corporation 100,000.00 3.3956%

TOTAL 2,945,000.00$                       100.0000%
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4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP ( Court File No.: CV-18-00604721-00CL)

Lender Original Loan Amount Percentage of Loan

1 1862199 Ontario Inc.( ASO Sandie Murphy) 50,000.00 1.1111%

2 2083294 Ontario Inc. ( ASO: Antonio Barreto) 200,000.00 4.4444%

3 2174912 Ontario Inc. c/o Michael Wong 100,000.00 2.2222%

4 2331144 Ontario Ltd (ASO: Beata Grygowski) 100,000.00 2.2222%

5 995820 Ontario Inc. c/o Tammy Lee 100,000.00 2.2222%

6 REMCO HOLDINGS ONTARIO LTD 100,000.00 2.2222%

7 John Francis Footprints Limited (formerly Chelsea Francis Family Trust) 250,000.00 5.5556%

8 Daniele Carnevale 150,000.00 3.3333%

9 Dr. Bernard Y.T. Li Medicine Professional Corporation          100,000.00 2.2222%

10 Dr. Bryan Chan Dentistry Professional Corporation               50,000.00 1.1111%

11 Dr. Dakin Lee Dentistry Professional Corporation                   100,000.00 2.2222%

12 Dr. Hoppy Hui Dentistry Professional Corporation                  50,000.00 1.1111%

13 Dr. William Chiu Dentistry Professional Corporation             50,000.00 1.1111%

14 Ed Heakes 50,000.00 1.1111%

15 Eddie Siek-Hin Leung 150,000.00 3.3333%

16 Frank Geier 400,000.00 8.8889%

17 Frank Greco 125,000.00 2.7778%

18 Jack Shinehoft Professional Corp 100,000.00 2.2222%

19 James Greenwood 200,000.00 4.4444%

20 Karim Naser 100,000.00 2.2222%

21 John Francis Footprints Limited (formerly Kathryn Francis Family Trust) 250,000.00 5.5556%

22 Les Wojtanowski 50,000.00 1.1111%

23 Danuta Wojtanowski 50,000.00 1.1111%

24 Mark and Julia Wong 100,000.00 2.2222%

25 Michael Longo 100,000.00 2.2222%

26 Naveera Mahum 200,000.00 4.4444%

27 Peter Volpe 100,000.00 2.2222%

28 Riccardo Carnavale 150,000.00 3.3333%

29 SDA Services Group Inc (ASO Luis Leite) 250,000.00 5.5556%

30 Stephen Kwok Professional Corporation 200,000.00 4.4444%

31 Katherine Suedan (formerly Teresa DiMarco)     150,000.00 3.3333%

32 Tony Vella 25,000.00 0.5556%

33 Wendy Dixon Dejonge Trust 150,000.00 3.3333%

34 Wilma Ieong & Eric Sito 200,000.00 4.4444%

Total 4,500,000.00$                 100.0000%
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Court File No.: CV-18-00604717-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

THE HONOURABLE MR. 

JUSTICE CAVANAGH 

)

)

) 

WEDNESDAY, THE 11th 

DAY OF AUGUST, 2021

B E T W E E N: 

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent 

Applicant 

- and - 

2407553 ONTARIO INC., 2384648 ONTARIO INC., 2384646 ONTARIO INC., 2400196 
ONTARIO INC. and 2396139 ONTARIO INC. 

Respondents

ORDER  
(Interim Distribution) 

THIS MOTION, made by Zeifman Partners Inc. in its capacity as the Court-appointed 

receiver (the “Receiver”) of the undertaking, property and assets of 2407553 Ontario Inc., 

2384648 Ontario Inc., 2384646 Ontario Inc., 2400196 Ontario Inc., and 2396139 Ontario Inc. 

(collectively, the “Debtors”), for an order approving an interim distribution and granting certain 

other relief, was heard this day via videoconference:  

ON READING the Third Report of the Receiver, dated July 29, 2021 (the “Third 

Report”), and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the Receiver and any other party 

appearing: 
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SERVICE 

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service of the Notice of Motion and Motion 

Record is abridged and validated such that this Motion is properly returnable today, and further 

service of the Notice of motion and the Motion Record is hereby dispensed with. 

RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES  

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Third Report and the activities of the Receiver as 

described therein be and are hereby approved other than paragraph 36 and Appendix KK of the 

Third Report. 

RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver’s interim statement of receipts and 

disbursements, for the period from October 14, 2020, to July 26, 2021, be and is hereby 

approved. 

INTERIM DISTRIBUTION 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DIRECTS  the Receiver to make an interim distribution 

totalling $4,100,000 (the “Interim Distribution Amount”) out of the net proceeds available in 

the estate of the Debtors, as follows: 

a) pay the expenses of the Applicant; and 

b) after payment of the Applicant’s expenses, distribute the remaining Interim 

Distribution Amount to the lenders listed in Appendix “A” attached hereto in 

accordance with their respective loan percentages. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that the payments permitted under paragraph 4(a) is without 

prejudice to the ability of the Respondents, and their principals, to challenge the propriety of any 

of the Applicant’s expenses. 

_______________________________________ 

Digitally signed by 
Mr. Justice Cavanagh
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Appendix “A” 

Lender Original Loan 
Amount

Percentage of Loan 
SRnED Limited (Earl Viner) 100,000.00 1.4286%

Lakes Holdings Ltd. (Earl Viner) 350,000.00 5.0000%

Marni Feingold (Earl Viner's niece) 50,000.00 0.7143%

Marjan Misiurak Holdings Inc. 100,000.00 1.4286%

JLL Developments Inc. 200,000.00 2.8571%

Susanna and Sheldon Kwok 300,000.00 4.2857%

Stephen Kwok Professional Corporation 350,000.00 5.0000%

Hilary and Lan Ma 200,000.00 2.8571%

Mark and Julia Wong 200,000.00 2.8571%

Edith Lau 50,000.00 0.7143%

ESTS Incorporated (Wilma Ieong) 100,000.00 1.4286%

Raymond Yeung 100,000.00 1.4286%

Dr. Ian Lo Dentistry Professional Corporation 100,000.00 1.4286%

995820 Ontario Inc. c/o Tammy Lee 100,000.00 1.4286%

2174912 Ontario Inc. c/o Michael Wong 200,000.00 2.8571%

Dr. William Chiu Dentistry Professional Corporation 300,000.00 4.2857%

Dr. Bryan Chan Dentistry Professional Corporation 150,000.00 2.1429%

Dr. Bernard Y.T. Li Medicine Professional Corporation 100,000.00 1.4286%

Dr. Wing K. Tse Medicine Professional Corporation 100,000.00 1.4286%

Dr. Dakin Lee Dentistry Professional Corporation 100,000.00 1.4286%

Dr. Hoppy Hui Dentistry Professional Corporation 150,000.00 2.1429%

Eddie Siek-Hin Leung 100,000.00 1.4286%

John Francis Footprints Limited 500,000.00 7.1429%

1862199 Ontario Inc.( ASO Sandie Murphy) 100,000.00 1.4286%

Frank DiMarco In Trust (formerly Alfredo & Maria DiMarco) 500,000.00 7.1429%

1599732 Ontario Limited( ASO: Randy Miller) 200,000.00 2.8571%

2083294 Ontario Inc. ( ASO: Antonio Baretto) 200,000.00 2.8571%

Michael Longo, Riccardo Carnevale, Daniele Carnevale 215,000.00 3.0714%

Riccardo Carnevale 130,000.00 1.8571%

Daniele Carnevale 125,000.00 1.7857%

Lindwall Holdings Inc. 270,000.00 3.8571%

2331144 Ontario Ltd (ASO: Beata Grygowski) 100,000.00 1.4286%

Leslaw and Danuta Wojtanowski 100,000.00 1.4286%

MLC Financial Ltd. (ASO: Mark Curtis) 100,000.00 1.4286%

Fox Realty Corp. 50,000.00 0.7143%

MCL Communications Ltd.(c/o Mr. Kim Lockhart) 200,000.00 2.8571%

Nadir Janmohammed 200,000.00 2.8571%

David Goncalves (formerly Walji) 200,000.00 2.8571%

Faiza Kassam and Nazir Kassam 75,000.00 1.0714%

Sabrina Kassam and Rizwan Mohamed 35,000.00 0.5000%

Karim Naser 100,000.00 1.4286%

Remco Holdings Inc 100,000.00 1.4286%

Total $ 7,000,000.00 100.0000%
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Court File No. CV-18-00604725-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST)    

THE HONOURABLE MR. 

JUSTICE CAVANAGH 

)

)

) 

WEDNESDAY, THE 11th 

DAY OF AUGUST, 2021

B E T W E E N:   

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

4267 RIVER ROAD LP and 4267 RIVER ROAD GP INC. 

Respondents

ORDER  
(Interim Distribution) 

THIS MOTION, made by Zeifman Partners Inc. in its capacity as the Court-appointed 

Receiver (the “Receiver”) of the assets, undertakings and properties of 4267 River Road LP and 

4267 River Road GP Inc. (together, the “Debtors”) for an order approving an interim 

distribution and granting certain other relief, was heard this day via videoconference.   

ON READING the Third Report of the Receiver, dated July 29, 2021 (the “Third 

Report”), and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the Receiver and any other party 

appearing: 
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-2- 

SERVICE 

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service of the Notice of Motion and Motion 

Record is abridged and validated such that this Motion is properly returnable today, and further 

service of the Notice of motion and the Motion Record is hereby dispensed with. 

RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES  

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Third Report and the activities of the Receiver as 

described therein be and are hereby approved other than paragraph 36 and Appendix KK of the 

Third Report. 

RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver’s interim statement of receipts and 

disbursements, for the period from October 14, 2020, to July 26, 2021, be and is hereby 

approved. 

INTERIM DISTRIBUTION 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DIRECTS  the Receiver to make an interim distribution 

totalling $2,650,000 (the “Interim Distribution Amount”) out of the net proceeds available in 

the estate of the Debtors, as follows: 

a) pay the expenses of the Applicant; and 

b) after payment of the Applicant’s expenses, distribute the remaining Interim 

Distribution Amount to the lenders listed in Appendix “A” attached hereto in 

accordance with their respective loan percentages. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that the payments permitted under paragraph 4(a) is without 

prejudice to the ability of the Respondents, and their principals, to challenge the propriety of any 

of the Applicant’s expenses. 

_______________________________________ 

Digitally signed by 
Mr. Justice Cavanagh
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Appendix “A” 

Lender Original Loan 
Amount

Percentage of Loan
Faiza & Nazir Kassam 200,000.00 6.7912%

485 Kingston Road Limited (Svetlana Dimitroff) 460,000.00 15.6197%
Dr. Svetlana Dimitroff 260,000.00 8.8285%

Daveni Investments Ltd. (Earl Viner) 200,000.00 6.7912%
Campana Consulting 100,000.00 3.3956%

Jack Shinehoft Professional Corporation 50,000.00 1.6978%
Senol & Fatima Tasdelin 300,000.00 10.1868%

Remco Holdings 25,000.00 0.8489%
Onally & Sofia Rahemtulla 75,000.00 2.5467%

Rose Consultants Limited (Bryan Pilutti) 200,000.00 6.7912%
Tony Lee 150,000.00 5.0934%
Willis Qu 150,000.00 5.0934%
Stephen & Susanna Kwok 100,000.00 3.3956%
1221455 Ontario Limited (Kwok) 100,000.00 3.3956%
Wilma Ieong Professional Corporation 100,000.00 3.3956%
Ditchburn Consulting Inc. (Tony Ditchburn) 75,000.00 2.5467%
Edith Lai Yuk Chiu 100,000.00 3.3956%
Mark & Julia Wong 100,000.00 3.3956%
Raymond Yeung 100,000.00 3.3956%
Dr Ian Lo Dentistry Professional Corporation 100,000.00 3.3956%

TOTAL $ $2,945,000.00 100.0000%
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Court File No. CV-18-00604721-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

COMMERCIAL LIST    

THE HONOURABLE MR. 

JUSTICE CAVANAGH 

)

)

) 

WEDNESDAY, THE 11th 

DAY OF AUGUST, 2021

B E T W E E N:   

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE LP and 4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE GP INC. 

Respondents 

ORDER  
(Interim Distribution) 

THIS MOTION, made by Zeifman Partners Inc. in its capacity as the Court-appointed 

receiver (the “Receiver”) of the undertaking, property and assets of 4544 Zimmerman Avenue 

LP and 4544 Zimmerman Avenue GP Inc. (the “Debtors”), for an order approving an interim 

distribution and granting certain other relief, was heard this day via videoconference. 

ON READING the Third Report of the Receiver, dated July 29, 2021 (the “Third 

Report”), and on hearing the submissions of counsel for the Receiver and any other party 

appearing: 
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SERVICE 

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the time for service of the Notice of Motion and Motion 

Record is abridged and validated such that this Motion is properly returnable today, and further 

service of the Notice of motion and the Motion Record is hereby dispensed with. 

RECEIVER’S ACTIVITIES  

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Third Report and the activities of the Receiver as 

described therein be and are hereby approved other than paragraph 36 and Appendix KK of the 

Third Report. 

RECEIPTS AND DISBURSEMENTS 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver’s interim statement of receipts and 

disbursements, for the period from October 14, 2020, to July 26, 2021, be and is hereby 

approved. 

INTERIM DISTRIBUTION 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DIRECTS  the Receiver to make an interim distribution 

totalling $1,540,000 (the “Interim Distribution Amount”) out of the net proceeds available in 

the estate of the Debtors, as follows: 

a) pay the expenses of the Applicant; and 

b) after payment of the Applicant’s expenses, distribute the remaining Interim 

Distribution Amount to the lenders listed in Appendix “A” attached hereto in 

accordance with their respective loan percentages. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that the payments permitted under paragraph 4(a) is without 

prejudice to the ability of the Respondents, and their principals, to challenge the propriety of any 

of the Applicant’s expenses. 

_______________________________________ 

Digitally signed by 
Mr. Justice Cavanagh

98



Appendix “A” 

Lender Original Loan Amount Percentage of Loan 
1862199 Ontario Inc.( ASO Sandie Murphy) 50,000.00 1.1111%

2083294 Ontario Inc. ( ASO: Antonio Barreto) 200,000.00 4.4444%

2174912 Ontario Inc. c/o Michael Wong 100,000.00 2.2222%

2331144 Ontario Ltd (ASO: Beata Grygowski) 100,000.00 2.2222%

995820 Ontario Inc. c/o Tammy Lee 100,000.00 2.2222%

REMCO HOLDINGS ONTARIO LTD 100,000.00 2.2222%

John Francis Footprints Limited (formerly Chelsea Francis Family Trust) 250,000.00 5.5556%

Daniele Carnevale 150,000.00 3.3333%

Dr. Bernard Y.T. Li Medicine Professional Corporation 100,000.00 2.2222%

Dr. Bryan Chan Dentistry Professional Corporation 50,000.00 1.1111%

Dr. Dakin Lee Dentistry Professional Corporation 100,000.00 2.2222%

Dr. Hoppy Hui Dentistry Professional Corporation 50,000.00 1.1111%

Dr. William Chiu Dentistry Professional Corporation 50,000.00 1.1111%

Ed Heakes 50,000.00 1.1111%

Eddie Siek-Hin Leung 150,000.00 3.3333%

Frank Geier 400,000.00 8.8889%

Frank Greco 125,000.00 2.7778%

Jack Shinehoft Professional Corp 100,000.00 2.2222%

James Greenwood 200,000.00 4.4444%

Karim Naser 100,000.00 2.2222%

John Francis Footprints Limited (formerly Kathryn Francis Family Trust) 250,000.00 5.5556%

Les Wojtanowski 50,000.00 1.1111%

Danuta Wojtanowski 50,000.00 1.1111%

Mark and Julia Wong 100,000.00 2.2222%

Michael Longo 100,000.00 2.2222%

Naveera Mahum 200,000.00 4.4444%

Peter Volpe 100,000.00 2.2222%

Riccardo Carnavale 150,000.00 3.3333%

SDA Services Group Inc (ASO Luis Leite) 250,000.00 5.5556%

Stephen Kwok Professional Corporation 200,000.00 4.4444%

Katherine Suedan (formerly Teresa DiMarco) 150,000.00 3.3333%

Tony Vella 25,000.00 0.5556%

Wendy Dixon Dejonge Trust 150,000.00 3.3333%

Wilma Ieong & Eric Sito 200,000.00 4.4444%

Total $ 4,500,000.00 100.0000%
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Moncur Mowbray LLP 
__________________________________________ 

Rachelle F. Moncur 
rmoncur@m2legal.ca 

2300 Yonge Street, Suite 1600 

Toronto, Ontario  M4P 1E4 

Tel: (416) 549-5056

September 23, 2021 

Delivered Via Email (Insolvency.Unit@ontario.ca, Leslie.Crawford@ontario.ca, 

diane.winters@justice.gc.ca) 

Delivered Via Courier to Canada Revenue Agency, National Insolvency Office 

MINISTRY OF FINANCE

Legal Services Branch 

33 King Street West, 6th Floor

P.O. Box 327, Stn. A

Oshawa, ON  L1H 8H5

Attention: Leslie Crawford

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Ontario Regional office

The Exchanging Tower, Box 36

130 King Street West, Suite 3400

Toronto, ON  M5X 1K6

Attention: Diane Winters 

CANADA REVENUE AGENCY

National Insolvency Office

1 Front Street West

2nd Floor, Suite 100

Toronto, ON  M5J 2X6

Attention: D. Pesikan (Collections Officer – Insolvency) 

Sirs / Madams: 

Re: Marchant Realty Partners Inc., as Agent v. 2407553 Ontario Inc. et. al.  

(CV-18-00604717-00CL & M52417) 

Marchant Realty Partners Inc., as Agent v. 4267 River Road LP, et. al. 

(CV-18-00604725-00CL & M52419) 

Marchant Realty Partners Inc., as Agent v. 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. 

(CV-18-00604721-00CL & M52418) 

We are independent counsel to Zeifman Partners Inc., in its capacity as Court-Appointed Receiver of 

2407553 Ontario Inc., 2384648 Ontario Inc., 2384646 Ontario Inc., 24000196 Ontario Inc., 2396139 

Ontario Inc., 4267 River Road LP, 4267 River Road GP Inc., 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP and 4544 

Zimmerman Avenue GP Inc. (collectively, the “Debtors”). 

GST/HST Payable 

The CRA assessed GST/HST owing by 4267 River Road LP and 4267 River Road GP Inc. (together, 

“4267 River Road”) in the following amounts: 
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Debtor Period GST/HST 

Outstanding 

GST/HST Assessed 

(including penalties 

and interest)

4267 River Road LP 2019 $23,714.88

2018 $16,558.86

4267 River Road GP Inc. 2018 $4,291.99

As of the date hereof, the CRA has not assessed GST/HST or any other amounts owing by any of the other 

Debtors.  

Real Properties and Mortgages 

The monies held by the Receiver for distribution are proceeds from the sale of real properties located in 

Niagara Falls, Ontario (collectively, the “Real Properties”). 

The Receiver sold each of the Real Properties pursuant to Approval and Vesting Orders, dated June 24, 

2021.  Prior to the closing of the sale transactions, each of the Real Properties were subject to first-ranking 

mortgages (the “Mortgages”) registered in favour of Marchant Realty Partners Inc., as Agent on behalf of 

consortiums of lenders (the “Lenders”): 

Real Property Mortgage Registration 
Date 

Mortgage Principal 
Amount 

4249-4267 River Road October 23, 2013 $2,945,000

4299 Queen Street 

4551 Zimmerman Avenue 

4100 Bridge Street 

4122 Bridge Street & 4538 Cataract 
Avenue 

March 13, 2014 $7,000,000

4544 & 4552 Zimmerman Avenue December 2, 2014 $5,500,000

Total $15,445,000

Further details of the Real Properties and Mortgages are set out in the Receiver’s Third Report, dated July 

29, 2021 (without appendices), a copy of which is attached hereto for your reference.   

4249-4267 River Road Mortgage 

The Mortgage registered against 4249-4267 River Road was registered on October 13, 2013, prior in time 

to the date of 4267 River Road’s GST/HST liability.  Accordingly, pursuant to Section 222(4) of the Excise 

Tax Act (Canada) and related regulations, the Mortgage constitutes a “prescribed security interest” and any 

deemed trust in favour of the CRA in respect of the 4267 River Road’s GST/HST liability ranks subsequent 

to the Mortgage. 
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Final Distribution to Lenders 

The Receiver will be bringing a motion before the Court, returnable October 5, 2021, requesting its 

discharge and authority to make a final distribution of all monies held by the Receiver.   

On behalf of the Receiver, we advise that, the Receiver will not make a final distribution to the Lenders 

until the expiry of twelve (12) weeks from the date hereof, unless CRA consents in writing to such 

distribution.  In the event CRA opposes the proposed final distribution to the Lenders, please respond to 

this letter indicating the reasons for such opposition and deliver such response on or before December 

16, 2021. 

Upon expiry of the twelve (12) week period, if CRA has not responded to this letter or otherwise opposed 

the distribution to the Lenders, the Receiver will proceed with the final distribution to the Lenders, in priority 

to any claim of CRA, and file its discharge certificate.  

Yours truly, 

Moncur Mowbray LLP 

Rachelle Moncur 

Enclosure:  Third Report of the Receiver, dated July 29, 2021 (without appendices) 
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Sara-Ann Van Allen
Counsel 

sara.wilson@dentons.com 
D +1 416 863 4402 

Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre

Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

dentons.com

Sirote ► Adepetun Caxton-Martins Agbor & Segun ► Davis Brown ► East African Law Chambers ► Eric Silwamba, Jalasi and Linyama ►
Durham Jones & Pinegar ► LEAD Advogados ► Rattagan Macchiavello Arocena ► Jiménez de Aréchaga, Viana & Brause ► Lee International ► 

Kensington Swan ► Bingham Greenebaum ► Cohen & Grigsby ► Sayarh & Menjra ► For more information on the firms that have come together 
to form Dentons, go to dentons.com/legacyfirms

NATDOCS\57693480\V-1 

September 9, 2021 File No.:  584164-1 

Sent Via E-mail 

jleavens@niagarafalls.ca 

Jon Leavens

Acting Director of Finance

City of Niagara Falls

4310 Queen Street 

Niagara Falls, ON  L2E 6X5

Dear Sir: 

Re: 4538 Cataract Ave, Niagara Falls, Ontario (the “Property”) and Invoice #63736, dated December 

8, 2020 totaling $65,965.34 (the “Invoice”) 

We are counsel to Zeifman Partners Inc., in its capacity as the court-appointed Receiver of 2407553 

Ontario Inc. et al.  A copy of the Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice appointing the Receiver, 

dated August 6, 2020, is attached hereto. 

We refer to your email, dated September 3, 2021, and the various previous email correspondence from 

the Receiver to the City of Niagara Falls (the “City”) in respect of the Invoice.  

All property tax arrears for the Property (including the total amount of the Invoice) were paid in full by the 

Receiver on July 5, 2021 upon the sale of the Property.  The Invoice was paid by the Receiver under 

protest as satisfactory documentation establishing the basis for the $65,965.34 charges has not been 

provided by the City to the Receiver. 

Despite its repeated requests for particulars in respect of the Invoice and the $65,965.34 charges, the 

City has failed to provide to the Receiver any documentation or explanation for the quantum of charges.    

Please provide to the Receiver, on or before September 15, 2021, (a) a detailed breakdown of the 

$65,965.34 charges, including any dumping fees, equipment rental charges and other costs related to the 

cleanup of the Property; (b) all related documentation and invoices including, but not limited to, the 

dumping fee invoice, supporting dumping cards and equipment rental invoices; and (c) a description of 

the process undertaken by the City to tender bids for the cleanup work. 
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Jon Leavens 

September 9, 2021 

Page 2 

dentons.com

NATDOCS\57693480\V-1 

The Receiver will report to the Court in respect of this issue at its next court hearing, which is currently 

scheduled for October 5, 2021. 

Yours truly, 

Dentons Canada LLP 

Sara-Ann Van Allen 

Counsel 

SW/ac 

cc. Allan Rutman and Roman Konovalov (Zeifman Partners Inc.) 

Kenneth Kraft (Dentons Canada LLP) 

Enclosure 
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Campbell, Amanda

From: Jonathan Leavens <jleavens@niagarafalls.ca>

Sent: Monday, September 13, 2021 4:23 PM

To: Campbell, Amanda

Cc: Kraft, Kenneth; Wilson, Sara-Ann; aar@zeifmans.ca; rkk@zeifmans.ca; Ed Lustig; Janet 

McQuay; Jo Zambito; Dave Butyniec

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL]-4538 Cataract Ave & Invoice No. 63736

Attachments: 4538 CATARACT AVE -  Incident 20-0002419_R.pdf; CNF ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE 

DOCUMENTATION AND SUPPORT.pdf; FIRE PROCUREMENT DESCRIPTION.pdf

[WARNING: EXTERNAL SENDER]

Good afternoon Amanda, 

In response to the letter, please see the attached documents. 

Thanks, 

Jon Leavens, CPA, CA |  Acting Director of Finance  |  Finance  |  City of Niagara Falls
4310 Queen Street  |  Niagara Falls, ON L2E 6X5  |  (905) 356-7521 ext 4355  |  Fax 905-376-0759  | jleavens@niagarafalls.ca

From: Campbell, Amanda <amanda.campbell@dentons.com>  
Sent: Thursday, September 9, 2021 10:08 AM 
To: Jonathan Leavens <jleavens@niagarafalls.ca> 
Cc: Kraft, Kenneth <kenneth.kraft@dentons.com>; Wilson, Sara-Ann <sara.wilson@dentons.com>; aar@zeifmans.ca; 
rkk@zeifmans.ca 
Subject: [EXTERNAL]-4538 Cataract Ave & Invoice No. 63736 

Jon, 

Please see the attached letter from Sara-Ann Wilson. 

Kind regards, 
Amanda  

Amanda Campbell
Legal Assistant to Robert Kennedy and Sara-Ann Wilson

My pronouns are: She/Her/Hers

What’s Next? The answer is Talent. With more than 20,000 people, 12,000 lawyers and 200 locations, 
Dentons has the talent for what you need, where you need it.

D +1 416 863 4468
amanda.campbell@dentons.com
Website

Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400, Toronto-Dominion Centre Toronto, ON M5K 0A1 Canada

Sirote > Adepetun Caxton-Martins Agbor & Segun > Davis Brown > East African Law Chambers > Eric 
Silwamba, Jalasi and Linyama > Durham Jones & Pinegar > LEAD Advogados > Rattagan 
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Macchiavello Arocena > Jiménez de Aréchaga, Viana & Brause > Lee International > Kensington Swan 
> Bingham Greenebaum > Cohen & Grigsby > Sayarh & Menjra > For more information on the firms 
that have come together to form Dentons, go to //dentons.com/legacyfirms

Dentons is a global legal practice providing client services worldwide through its member firms and affiliates. This 
email may be confidential and protected by legal privilege. If you are not the intended recipient, disclosure, 
copying, distribution and use are prohibited; please notify us immediately and delete this email from your systems. 
To update your commercial electronic message preferences email dentonsinsightsca@dentons.com or visit our 
website. Please see dentons.com for Legal Notices.

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 
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Jonathan Leavens

From: Dave Butyniec
Sent: Friday, September 10, 2021 3:49 PM
To: Jonathan Leavens
Cc: Dave Butyniec
Subject: FW: Emergency Services Contractors 

Hi Jon, 
 
Please see Fires process for hiring Emergency Contractors below.   
 
Have a Great Weekend! 
 
Dave Butyniec |  Manager of Procurement  |  Finance  |  City of Niagara Falls 
3200 Stanley Avenue  |  Niagara Falls, ON L2E 6S4  |  (905) 356-7521 ext. 4300  |  dbutyniec@niagarafalls.ca 
 

From: Jo Zambito <jzambito@niagarafalls.ca>  
Sent: Friday, September 10, 2021 3:34 PM 
To: Dave Butyniec <dbutyniec@niagarafalls.ca> 
Subject: RE: Emergency Services Contractors  
 
Looks good. 
 
Thanks, 
 
jo 
 
Jo Zambito  |  Fire Chief  |  Fire Department  |  City of Niagara Falls 
5809 Morrison Street  |  Niagara Falls, ON L2E 2E8  |  (905) 356-1321   |  Fax 905-356-6236  | jzambito@niagarafalls.ca 

 

 
 

From: Dave Butyniec <dbutyniec@niagarafalls.ca>  
Sent: Friday, September 10, 2021 3:24 PM 
To: Jo Zambito <jzambito@niagarafalls.ca> 
Cc: Dave Butyniec <dbutyniec@niagarafalls.ca> 
Subject: Emergency Services Contractors  
 
Hi Jo, 
 
Please review the process below and ley me know if anything should change before I send it to 
Jon with regards to your process. 
 
Please see the excerpt that the Fire Department follows as per the FFPA which gives them the 
rights to entry and the authority without a warrant to remedy unsafe conditions: 
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Fire Protection and 
Prevention Act, 1997 

PART V 

RIGHTS OF ENTRY IN EMERGENCIES AND FIRE INVESTIGATIONS 

Entry on adjacent lands by firefighters, etc. 

13 (1) A firefighter or such other person as may be authorized by the fire chief, the Fire Marshal or an 
assistant to the Fire Marshal may, without a warrant, enter on lands or premises, 

(a) that are adjacent to the lands or premises on which a fire or emergency has occurred or is 
occurring, for the purposes of fighting the fire or of providing rescue or emergency services; or 

(b) that are adjacent to the lands or premises on which there is a serious threat to the health and 
safety of any person or the quality of the natural environment, for the purpose of removing or 
reducing the threat.  1997, c. 4, s. 13 (1); 2001, c. 25, s. 475 (4). 

Prevention of fire spreading 

(1.1) A firefighter or such other person as may be authorized by the fire chief may, without a warrant, 
enter on lands or premises on which a fire is occurring, or that are adjacent to those lands or premises, 
for the purposes of pulling down or removing buildings, structures or things on or attached to the lands 
or premises on which a fire is occurring or that are adjacent to those lands or premises if, in the opinion 
of the fire chief, it is necessary to do so to prevent the spread of the fire.  2001, c. 25, s. 475 (5). 

When an emergency is declared the Fire Department uses a pre-established roster list of 
qualified contractors to remedy the situation.  There are currently 8 contractors on that list that 
can provide various services for Fire in an emergency.  The Fire Department will call the 
contractors and dispatch the one that can respond the quickest depending on the emergency 
service required.  The work is completed on a time and material bases and billed to the City 
once completed. 
 
Thank you, 
 
Dave Butyniec |  Manager of Procurement  |  Finance  |  City of Niagara Falls 
3200 Stanley Avenue  |  Niagara Falls, ON L2E 6S4  |  (905) 356-7521 ext. 4300  |  dbutyniec@niagarafalls.ca 
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Sara-Ann Van Allen
Counsel 

sara.wilson@dentons.com 
D +1 416 863 4402 

Dentons Canada LLP

77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre

Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

dentons.com

Sirote ► Adepetun Caxton-Martins Agbor & Segun ► Davis Brown ► East African Law Chambers ► Eric Silwamba, Jalasi and Linyama ►
Durham Jones & Pinegar ► LEAD Advogados ► Rattagan Macchiavello Arocena ► Jiménez de Aréchaga, Viana & Brause ► Lee International ► 

Kensington Swan ► Bingham Greenebaum ► Cohen & Grigsby ► Sayarh & Menjra ► For more information on the firms that have come together 
to form Dentons, go to dentons.com/legacyfirms

NATDOCS\58009027\V-1 

September 21, 2021 File No.:  584164-1 

Sent Via E-mail 

jleavens@niagarafalls.ca 

Jon Leavens

Acting Director of Finance

City of Niagara Falls

4310 Queen Street 

Niagara Falls, ON  L2E 6X5

Dear Sir: 

Re: 4538 Cataract Ave, Niagara Falls, Ontario and Invoice #63736, dated December 8, 2020 totaling 

$65,965.34 

We are in receipt of your email, dated September 13, 2021 and the documentation attached thereto.   

Further to our letter, dated September 9, 2021, the Receiver requires the following documentation in 

respect of the charges set out on Invoice 5123 issued by PRW Excavating Contractors Ltd. to the Niagara 

Falls Fire Department, dated October 26, 2020 (the “PRW Excavating Invoice”): 

(a) detailed cost breakdown of the $43,000 charge for “Trucking and Disposal”, including, but not 
limited to, dumping cards, dumping invoices, equipment rental costs and details of labor costs; 

(b) detailed cost breakdown of the $9,000 charge for “Long Reach Emergency Mobilization”; 

(c) detailed cost breakdown of the $4,750 charge for “Fill Basement and Grade”; and 

(d) a description of the process undertaken by the City of Niagara Falls to determine the costs noted 
in the PRW Excavating Invoice were reasonable and appropriate.  
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Jon Leavens 

September 21, 2021 

Page 2 

dentons.com

NATDOCS\58009027\V-1 

The above described documents were not attached to your September 13, 2021 email and remain 

outstanding at this time.  Please provide the additional documentation on or before September 24, 2021. 

Yours truly, 

Dentons Canada LLP 

Sara-Ann Van Allen 

Counsel 

SW/ac 

cc. Allan Rutman and Roman Konovalov (Zeifman Partners Inc.) 

Kenneth Kraft (Dentons Canada LLP) 
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Court File No.: CV-18-00604717-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

BETWEEN:

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

2407553 ONTARIO INC., 2384648 ONTARIO INC., 2384646 ONTARIO INC., 24000196 ONTARIO INC. 
and 2396139 ONTARIO INC. 

Respondents 

Court File No. CV-18-00604725-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

BETWEEN:

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

4267 RIVER ROAD LP and 4267 RIVER ROAD GP INC. 

Respondents 

Court File No.: CV-18-00604721-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST)

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent 

BETWEEN:

Applicant 

- and - 

4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE LP and 4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE GP INC. 

Respondents

AFFIDAVIT OF KENNETH KRAFT 

(Affirmed September 20, 2021) 
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I, KENNETH KRAFT, of the City of Toronto, in the Province of Ontario, AFFIRM AND 

SAY as follows: 

1. I am a Partner with Dentons Canada LLP (“Dentons”), and as such, I have knowledge of 

the matters to which I hereinafter depose.   

2. Dentons is counsel to Zeifman Partners Inc. in its capacity as Receiver (the “Receiver”) in 

three companion receivership applications.  The Receiver was appointed pursuant to the Orders of 

the Honourable Justice Gilmore, dated August 6, 2020 (collectively, the “Receivership Orders”) 

bearing Commercial List Court File numbers, (a) CV-18-00604717-00CL (the “240 

Application”), (b) CV-18-00604725-00CL (the “River Road Application”), and (c) CV-18-

00604721-00CL (the “Zimmerman Application”). 

3. The Receivership Orders provide at paragraph 17 that the Receiver, and counsel to the 

Receiver, shall be paid their reasonable fees and disbursements at their standard rates and charges.  

4. Dentons fees and disbursements for each application are accounted for separately.  The 

Dentons fees and disbursements for the period of June 1, 2021 to September 15, 2021 (the “Fee 

Period”), are summarized in the invoices rendered to the Receiver (the “Invoices”).  The Invoices 

are a fair and accurate description of the services provided, the disbursements incurred and the 

amounts charged by Dentons.  A copy of the Invoices relating to three separate applications are 

attached hereto as follows: 

(a) 240 Application - Exhibit “A”; 

(b) River Road Application - Exhibit “B”; and 

(c) Zimmerman Application - Exhibit “C”. 

5. Attached and marked as Exhibit “D” are schedules summarizing the Invoices, the total 

billable hours charged, the total fees charged and the average hourly rate charged.  

6. Attached and marked as Exhibit “E” is a schedule summarizing the respective years of 

call and standard billing rates of each of the solicitors at Dentons who acted for the Receiver.  
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THIS IS EXHIBIT "A" REFERRED TO IN THE 

AFFIDAVIT OF KENNETH KRAFT AFFIRMED 

BEFORE ME THIS 20th DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2021. 

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc. 
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3598403

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
June 30, 2021 584164-000001 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al.

Professional Fees $ 16,257.50

Disbursements 342.00

HST (13.0%) on $16,279.50 2,116.34

Total Amount Due                                               $ 18,715.84  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.

 

DocuSign Envelope ID: 2382F534-C1A5-4F14-ADA0-154193FA8211

212



DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598403
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 5
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

01-Jun-21 SW Receipt of letter from accountant and emails regarding same. Emails 
regarding APS. Instructions to Fabian Abele.

0.3

01-Jun-21 KK Purchase agreement follow up matters. 0.1

02-Jun-21 KK Email updates. 0.1

03-Jun-21 SW Receipt and review of revised AVO and email regarding same.  Emails 
regarding AVO.

0.4

03-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding purchase agreement and 
related matters. Emailing with Daniel Kumer regarding closing agenda 
and related matters.

0.1

03-Jun-21 KK Various email exchanges related to purchase agreement on vesting 
orders.

0.1

04-Jun-21 SW Review and respond to email from Fabian Abele regarding vesting 
order. Review emails regarding vesting orders.

0.2

04-Jun-21 FA Reviewing research regarding vesting order matters. Emailing with 
Sara-Ann Wilson regarding vesting order matters. Emailing with Daniel 
Kumer regarding vesting order matters.

0.1

04-Jun-21 KK Transaction related emails. 0.1

07-Jun-21 SW Review vesting order and instructions regarding same.  Consider 
vesting orders.  Draft notice of motion.  Review and revise fee affidavit.

1.3

08-Jun-21 SW Review pre-closing conditions and emails from and to Fabian Abele 
regarding same.  Revise notice of motion and instructions regarding fee 
affidavit.  Revise administrative order. Review closing agenda and email 
regarding same. Revise vesting order. Email to Friedmans.

0.9

08-Jun-21 FA Drafting Closing Agenda. Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding 
closing agenda matters. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding closing 
agenda matters.

0.4

08-Jun-21 KK Emails. Review revisions to draft vesting order. 0.1

09-Jun-21 SW Email from Daniel Kumar regarding closing agenda. Instructions 
regarding second report. Review emails regarding costs. Draft second 
report.

2.6

09-Jun-21 KK Exchanges on projected costs and remaining matters. 0.1

10-Jun-21 SW Draft confidential appendix and instructions regarding same. 
Instructions regarding confidential appendix.

0.8

11-Jun-21 KK Working on sale approval motion material. 0.1

13-Jun-21 KK Working on sale approval motion materials. 0.1

14-Jun-21 SW Instructions regarding fee affidavit and emails regarding same.  Email 
regarding vesting order. Commission fee affidavit and instructions 
regarding updating report.  Email draft report to Zeifmans. Review 

1.0

DocuSign Envelope ID: 2382F534-C1A5-4F14-ADA0-154193FA8211
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598403
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 3 of 5
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

Date ID Description of Work Hours

revisions to report and instructions. Review motion record index. 
Emails regarding property taxes. Emails regarding security review.  
Receipt and review of comments on draft report.  Receipt and review 
of vesting order comments.  Call to Daniel Kumar regarding vesting 
order.  Revise Second Report and email to Receiver.

14-Jun-21 KK Working on sale approval motion material and related email 
exchanges. Meet with Sara-Ann Wilson to commission affidavit.

0.2

15-Jun-21 SW Finalize Second Report. Receipt and review of R&D and fee affidavit. 
Receipt of signature page to report.  Instructions regarding service. 
Review final motion records and service email.  Emails regarding 
property taxes and clean up costs.  Finalize administrative orders.

0.8

15-Jun-21 KK Review and finalize motion material. 0.1

16-Jun-21 SW Emails regarding closing date.  Emails regarding vesting orders.  Review 
and respond to email from Fabian Abele regarding clean up costs.

0.3

16-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding closing timing and related 
matters. Reviewing question regarding municipal tax matters and 
remediation on property. Emailing summary of results to Sara-Ann 
Wilson.

0.2

16-Jun-21 KK Emails related to closing date extension. 0.1

17-Jun-21 SW Review emails regarding closing documents. Revise vesting order, 
review blackline and email to Friedmans.  Emails regarding closing 
arrangements. Emails regarding property taxes.

0.6

17-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding closing and related matters. 
Emailing with Daniel Kumer regarding closing document and related 
matters.

0.1

18-Jun-21 SW Review and respond to emails from Roman Konovalov regarding 
property taxes.

0.3

18-Jun-21 FA Emails regarding tax search and related matters. Providing instructions 
to Zehan Jagosh regarding statement of adjustments drafting.

0.1

21-Jun-21 SW Review comments on vesting order and revise. Finalize vesting orders. 
Receipt and review of closing documents. Emails regarding closing 
documents.

1.0

21-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding closing document matters. 
Emailing with Daniel Kumer regarding closing document matters.

0.1

21-Jun-21 KK Various transaction related emails. 0.1

22-Jun-21 SW Circulate revised vesting orders and emails regarding same. Emails to 
and from Ken Kraft regarding motion.

0.3

22-Jun-21 KK Email exchanges on various closing points and on prep for Thursday's 
hearing.

0.1

23-Jun-21 SW Instructions regarding draft orders and review same.  Emails regarding 
court hearing.  Emails regarding closing documents.  Review and 
respond to email from Stephen Nadler regarding fees.

0.5

23-Jun-21 FA Reviewing closing documents and comments received from Buyers' 
lawyers. Drafting Statement of Adjustments. Emailing Daniel Kumer 

0.7

DocuSign Envelope ID: 2382F534-C1A5-4F14-ADA0-154193FA8211
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598403
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 4 of 5
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

Date ID Description of Work Hours

regarding Statement of Adjustments matters.

23-Jun-21 KK Emails related to tomorrow's hearing and to close transaction. 0.1

24-Jun-21 SW Emails regarding statement of adjustments. Prepare for vesting order 
motion. Review statement of adjustments. Attend motion for vesting 
orders.  Discussion with Ken Kraft regarding vesting order motions. 
Review revised statement of adjustments and emails. Emails to and 
from Allan Rutman regarding motion. Receipt and review of 
endorsement and orders and instructions and email regarding same.

1.7

24-Jun-21 FA Emails regarding Statement of Adjustments and closing document 
matters. Updating Statement of Adjustments. Further updating 
Statement of Adjustments. Emailing with Roman Konovalov regarding 
realty tax arrears matters. Finalizing updated closing documents. 
Drafting additional closing documents. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding 
closing document matters. Emailing Lopa Raulino regarding instructions 
for review of draft Application for Vesting Order.

1.0

24-Jun-21 KK Various emails related to today's hearing and various closing matters. 
Follow up discussion with Sara-Ann Wilson on issues. Review 
endorsement from hearing. Update email exchanges with Greg 
Marchant.

0.3

25-Jun-21 SW Emails regarding closing documents and payment of realty taxes. 
Instructions regarding order and endorsement. Emails regarding timing 
of closing. Review revised closing documents.

1.0

25-Jun-21 LR Review of email instructions from Fabian Abele. Review of procedures 
and electronic form of Application For Vesting Order.  Attend to 
provide comments on same, suggest pre-approval by Land Registry 
Office and forward email to Fabian Abele.

0.3

25-Jun-21 FA Emailing Sara-Ann Wilson regarding statement of adjustments, 
receiver's certificate and related matters. Reviewing application for 
vesting order. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding application for vesting 
order matters.

0.2

25-Jun-21 KK Closing related emails and updates. 0.1

28-Jun-21 SW Review emails regarding closing arrangements. Email to Fabian Abele 
regarding closing documents and review responding email.

0.2

28-Jun-21 FA Providing instructions to Zehan Jagosh regarding realty tax arrears 
summary sheet. Reviewing and updating realty tax arrears summary 
sheet. Drafting receivers certificates. Reviewing Applications for Vesting 
Order. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding closing and closing document 
matters. Emailing Allan Rutman regarding document execution and tax 
arrears matters.

0.8

28-Jun-21 KK Emails on various closing amounts and distributions. 0.1

29-Jun-21 SW Various emails and instructions regarding closing arrangements. Review 
receiver’s certificates and emails regarding same.  Review email 
regarding demolition costs.  Review revised receiver’s certificates. 
Emails regarding wire instructions.

0.6

29-Jun-21 FA Updating closing documents. Preparing materials for execution by Allan 
Rutman. Finalizing flow funds matters. Providing instructions to Crystal 

0.7

DocuSign Envelope ID: 2382F534-C1A5-4F14-ADA0-154193FA8211
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598403
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 5 of 5
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

Date ID Description of Work Hours

Zheng regarding wiring matters. Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson 
regarding receivers certificates and closing matters. Numerous emails 
with Daniel Kumer in preparation for closing.

29-Jun-21 KK Various emails on issues for closing tomorrow and payment logistics. 0.1

30-Jun-21 SW Various emails regarding closing. Receipt of executed closing 
documents.  Consider closing extension and instructions regarding 
same.

0.4

30-Jun-21 KK Addressing various closing delay issues, extension terms and related 
emails.

0.1

 Total 22.2

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees

Fabian Abele 4.5 640.00 2,880.00

Kenneth Kraft 2.2 990.00 2,178.00
Lopa Raulino 0.3 345.00 103.50

Sara-Ann Wilson 15.2 730.00 11,096.00

 Total 22.2 $16,257.50

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 16,257.50

TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Photocopy & Printing Charges $ 22.00

TOTAL TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 22.00

NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Filing Fee* $ 320.00

TOTAL NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 320.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 342.00

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 16,599.50

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $16,257.50 $ 2,113.48

HST (13.0%) on Taxable Disbursements of $22.00 2.86

TOTAL TAXES 2,116.34

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 18,715.84  CAD

DocuSign Envelope ID: 2382F534-C1A5-4F14-ADA0-154193FA8211
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3606531

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
July 31, 2021 584164-000001 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al.

Professional Fees $ 13,458.00

Disbursements 1,065.39

HST (13.0%) on $14,523.39 1,888.04

Total Amount Due                                               $ 16,411.43  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:  Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.

 

DocuSign Envelope ID: 3AF64E6B-9C14-4DE5-8110-E30227235AF0
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606531
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 5
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

02-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding closing funds. 0.2

02-Jul-21 FA Updating Statement of Adjustments. Emailing with Allan Rutman 
regarding closing and Statement of Adjustments matters. Emailing with 
Daniel Kumer regarding flow funds and closing matters.

0.3

02-Jul-21 KK Updated emails on closing adjustments. 0.1

05-Jul-21 SW Various emails regarding closing arrangements and receipt of funds. 
Emails regarding wire transfers. Emails regarding closing and 
distributions. Instructions regarding court availability. Emails regarding 
receiver’s certificates and cheques. Emails regarding security opinion. 
Emails regarding closing books and instructions regarding same.

0.6

05-Jul-21 FA Attending to closing of transaction. Managing flow of funds matters. 
Various emails regarding closing and related matters. Preparing record 
book materials. Finalizing receivers certificates.

0.9

05-Jul-21 KK Closing related emails. Emails on moving forward with distribution 
issues.

0.1

06-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding scheduling distribution motion.  Instructions regarding 
closing books and sending to independent counsel. Consider 
distribution materials. Emails regarding filing certificates and emails to 
Friedmans regarding same.  Receipt and review of costs endorsement 
and email to receiver. Review email from court and instructions to 
Amanda Campbell.  Draft notice of motion for distribution motion.

1.1

06-Jul-21 KK Review costs endorsement and update emails. 0.1

07-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding booking distribution motion and instructions to 
Amanda Campbell regarding same. Consider relief at motion.

0.2

08-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding security review.  Emails regarding call to discuss next 
steps.  Email to Greg Marchant regarding distribution motion. Continue 
drafting notice of motion.  Various emails regarding parcel registers and 
review same.  Instructions to Amanda Campbell regarding motion 
record and fee affidavits. Draft Third Report.

1.7

08-Jul-21 FA Emailing Sara-Ann Wilson regarding construction lien discharge 
matters. Reviewing parcel abstracts in respect of construction lien 
discharge matters. Additional emails with Daniel Kumer regarding 
updated parcel abstracts.

0.2

08-Jul-21 KK Emails on distribution and other remaining issues. 0.1

09-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding searches and review same. Continue drafting Third 
Report. Instructions to Amanda Campbell regarding forwarding 
searches to independent counsel. Review and revise fee affidavit.

1.2

12-Jul-21 RA Receive and review instructions from Sara-Ann Wilson. Ordering Bank 
Act and OWL searches. Reviewing same. Correspondence regarding 
same.

0.2

DocuSign Envelope ID: 3AF64E6B-9C14-4DE5-8110-E30227235AF0
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606531
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 3 of 5
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

Date ID Description of Work Hours

12-Jul-21 SW Request execution and bank act searches and emails regarding real 
property opinion. Receipt and review of searches and forward to 
Rachelle Moncur.

0.3

13-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding call. Call with Greg Marchant and Receiver regarding 
distribution and next steps.

0.2

13-Jul-21 KK Review enforceability opinion from independent counsel on personal 
property security. Conference call with Greg Marchant, Allan Rutman, 
Roman Konovalov, and Sara-Ann Wilson on remaining steps and 
distribution issues.

0.3

19-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding HST liability.  Review HST audit letters and consider 
HST priorities. Review ETA regarding HST priorities.  Call to Rachelle 
Moncur. Emails regarding service list. Call with receiver regarding 
motion. message to Rachelle Moncur.

0.9

19-Jul-21 KK Follow up on outstanding matters. Discussion with Allan Rutman, 
Roman Konovalov, and Sara-Ann Wilson on distribution motion issues.

0.3

20-Jul-21 SW Review and revise motion record.  Consider distribution mechanics. 
Revise notice of motion. Continue drafting third report. Review and 
respond to emails regarding intercompany loan information.

0.8

20-Jul-21 KK Review draft real estate enforceability opinion. Email exchanges on 
request to provide access to records.

0.1

21-Jul-21 SW Call with Rachelle Moncur.  Revise and update Third Report. 
Instructions regarding revising materials and updating appendices. 
Emails to and from Ken Kraft regarding distribution motion and 
consider same

0.8

21-Jul-21 KK Emails related to proposed distribution order. 0.1

22-Jul-21 SW Revise notice of motion. review loan agreements regarding lender’s 
fees.

0.4

22-Jul-21 KK Update emails. Review final versions of opinions on validity and 
enforceability of real property security.

0.1

23-Jul-21 SW Review real estate opinions and emails regarding same.  Message to 
Rachelle Moncur regarding motion.  Revise Third Report. Consider 
timing of service and emails regarding same.

0.8

23-Jul-21 KK Emails related to legal opinions and enforceability and distributions to 
lenders and on fee affidavits.

0.1

26-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding fee affidavits and supplemental report. Instructions to 
Amanda Campbell regarding reports and fee affidavit. Message to 
Rachelle Moncur regarding fee affidavit . Draft Supplemental Report. 
Emails to Greg Marchant regarding intercompany debts and loan 
amounts. Review and revise court materials.  Email to Receiver. Review 
email regarding Crystal Hotel and responding email to Receiver.  
Discussion with Roman Konovalov.

0.8

26-Jul-21 ZJ Drafting closing record book for Fabian Abele Read email from Abele, 
Fabian: Zeifman \\Marchant - Record book Composed email to Abele, 
Fabian: RE: Zeifman \\Marchant - Record book

1.1

26-Jul-21 KK Various emails related to issues to be addressed in motion materials 0.2

DocuSign Envelope ID: 3AF64E6B-9C14-4DE5-8110-E30227235AF0
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606531
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 4 of 5
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

Date ID Description of Work Hours

and outstanding matters.

27-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding call with receiver. call with receiver regarding 
potential discharge and outstanding items. Revise Third Report and 
forward to Ken Kraft. Review email from Ken Kraft to Greg Marchant. 
Messages to Rachelle Moncur.

0.8

27-Jul-21 ZJ Drafting closing record book for Fabian Abele 1.1

27-Jul-21 KK Emails. Discussion with Allan Rutman, Roman Konovalov and Sara-Ann 
Wilson to consider issues. Start to review draft report.

0.4

28-Jul-21 SW Receipt and review of updated loan amounts and lender listing.
Instructions to Amanda Campbell.  Revise notice of motion. Draft 
orders. Email draft materials to Ken Kraft. Review appendices and 
instructions regarding same.  Draft orders. Emails to and from Ken Kraft 
regarding draft materials and revise same.

1.1

28-Jul-21 KK Working on motion material and related email exchanges. 0.4

29-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding finalizing distribution materials.  Discussion with 
Rachelle Moncur regarding distribution materials.  Revise and finalize 
materials and instructions regarding service.  Emails regarding motion 
records and review final materials.

0.7

29-Jul-21 KK Emails on motion material and revisions to materials. 0.2

30-Jul-21 SW Email from Steven Nadler and emails regarding indebtedness amounts. 0.1

30-Jul-21 KK Email exchanges related to information requested as to calculations of 
loan amounts.

0.1

 Total 19.2

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Fabian Abele 1.4 640.00 896.00

Kenneth Kraft 2.7 990.00 2,673.00

Rennie Ali 0.2 230.00 46.00

Sara-Ann Wilson 12.7 730.00 9,271.00

Zehan Jagosh 2.2 260.00 572.00
 Total 19.2 $13,458.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 13,458.00

TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Photocopy & Printing Charges $ 141.25
Courier & Delivery 4.63
Searches 919.51

TOTAL TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 1,065.39

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 1,065.39

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 14,523.39

DocuSign Envelope ID: 3AF64E6B-9C14-4DE5-8110-E30227235AF0
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606531
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 5 of 5
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $13,458.00 $ 1,749.54

HST (13.0%) on Taxable Disbursements of $1,065.39 138.50

TOTAL TAXES 1,888.04

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 16,411.43  CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3611027

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
August 31, 2021 584164-000001 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al.

Professional Fees $ 4,598.00

Disbursements 332.80

HST (13.0%) on $4,610.80 599.40

Total Amount Due                                               $ 5,530.20  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3611027
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 3
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

04-Aug-21 SW Review email from Steven Nadler and email to Greg Marchant 
regarding same. Emails to and from Receiver regarding email from 
Stephen Nadler. Receipt and review of invoices from Greg Marchant.  
Review and finalize draft orders. Emails regarding Caselines.  Review 
email from Roman Konovalov to City of Niagara.

0.6

04-Aug-21 KK Emails related to further information requests. 0.1

05-Aug-21 SW Receipt of receiver’s invoices. Email to Stephen Nadler.  Emails to and 
from Rachelle Moncur regarding draft order and Caselines.

0.2

05-Aug-21 KK Various emails. 0.1

08-Aug-21 SW Emails to and from Rachelle Moncur regarding distribution motion. 0.1

10-Aug-21 SW Review and respond to email from Steven Nadler. Email to Ken Kraft. 0.1

10-Aug-21 KK Emails. Voice mails for Stephen Nadler. Review materials for 
tomorrow's motion.

0.2

11-Aug-21 SW Emails regarding distribution motion and revised orders.  Receipt and 
review of endorsement and orders.

0.2

12-Aug-21 SW Emails regarding issuing orders and service of same.  Review draft 
distribution from receiver.

0.2

12-Aug-21 KK Email exchanges regarding issued and entered orders and on finalizing 
interim distribution arrangements.

0.2

16-Aug-21 SW Review emails from Roman Konovalov and Jo Zambito regarding clean 
up costs.

0.2

16-Aug-21 KK Email exchanges with Allan Rutman and consider impact on 
receivership of pursuing litigation related claims for recovery of 
amounts transferred to related companies.

0.1

17-Aug-21 SW Review and respond to email from Allan Rutman and emails regarding 
distribution.  Review fee affidavit.

0.1

17-Aug-21 KK Telephone call with Allan Rutman to discuss issues. 0.1

18-Aug-21 KK Telephone call with Allan Rutman and Jeremy Sacks to discuss 
receivership and pursuit of receivables owed to debtors.

0.1

23-Aug-21 SW Review emails regarding distributions. 0.1

23-Aug-21 KK Emails exchanged with Greg Marchant and Allan Rutman related to 
Agent's request for update note to explain distributions.

0.1

24-Aug-21 SW Draft email to lenders and email to Ken Kraft. Review responding email. 0.1

25-Aug-21 SW Instructions to Amanda Campbell regarding discharge materials. 
Review and revise draft discharge order.  Draft discharge notice of 
motion.  Instructions regarding fee affidavit.

0.9

26-Aug-21 SW Review and revise draft discharge orders. Draft Fourth Report. Review 
and respond to email from Ken Kraft regarding discharge motion.  

1.1
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3611027
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 3 of 3
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

Date ID Description of Work Hours

Emails regarding bankruptcy application.

26-Aug-21 KK Emails exchanged related to bankruptcy and discharge of Receiver. 
Revise draft update note to lenders on distributions from Receiver.

0.2

27-Aug-21 SW Review email from Ken Kraft regarding communication to lenders. 
Review and revise draft communication to lenders and email to Allan 
Rutman. Review emails regarding email to lenders.  Email draft email to 
Greg Marchant. Revise email to lenders and resend.

0.2

27-Aug-21 KK Further emails to finalize notice to lenders from Receiver/Agent 
regarding distributions.

0.1

30-Aug-21 SW Emails regarding booking court time for discharge motion.  Instructions 
to Amanda Campbell regarding request form.  Emails regarding funding 
for bankruptcy.  Revise discharge notice of motion.  Instructions 
regarding zoom invite. Review email from Roman Konovalov to the city.

0.3

30-Aug-21 KK Discharge application related emails. 0.1

 Total 5.8

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees

Kenneth Kraft 1.4 990.00 1,386.00

Sara-Ann Wilson 4.4 730.00 3,212.00

 Total 5.8 $4,598.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 4,598.00

TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Binding Books / Documents $ 12.80

TOTAL TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 12.80

NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Filing Fee* $ 320.00

TOTAL NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 320.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 332.80

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 4,930.80

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $4,598.00 $ 597.74

HST (13.0%) on Taxable Disbursements of $12.80 1.66

TOTAL TAXES 599.40

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 5,530.20  CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3614850

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
September 15, 2021 584164-000001 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al.

Professional Fees $ 2,617.00

HST (13.0%) on $2,617.00 340.21

Total Amount Due                                               $ 2,957.21  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.

 

DocuSign Envelope ID: F086252D-8364-49F0-97DF-0D4763BF3A78

225



DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3614850
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 2
Re: 2407553 Ontario Inc., et al. Matter # 584164-000001

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

01-Sep-21 SW Emails regarding bankruptcy funding. Revise discharge notice of 
motion.

0.2

02-Sep-21 SW Review emails from Roman Konovalov and City of Niagara falls 
regarding demolition issue.

0.2

03-Sep-21 SW Review correspondence between Receiver and City of Niagara Falls. 
Emails regarding correspondence with the City regarding demolition 
costs.  Draft letter to City of Niagara Falls.

0.5

07-Sep-21 SW Revise letter to City and circulate to Receiver. Review email from 
Roman Konovalov. Revise letter and recirculate.

0.4

08-Sep-21 SW Emails regarding letter to City. 0.2

08-Sep-21 KK Review draft letter to City of NF regarding work done on property. 0.3

10-Sep-21 SW Revise and update discharge materials. Review fee affidavit. Email draft 
materials to Ken Kraft.

0.6

10-Sep-21 KK Email exchanges on discharge related materials and issues. 0.1

13-Sep-21 SW Receipt and review of information and documentation from the City of 
Niagara Falls.

0.3

13-Sep-21 KK Review follow up information from NF on property issues and clearance 
costs after fire.

0.3

15-Sep-21 SW Review and respond to emails regarding fee affidavit. 0.1

15-Sep-21 KK Working on discharge motion material. 0.1

 Total 3.3

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees

Kenneth Kraft 0.8 990.00 792.00

Sara-Ann Wilson 2.5 730.00 1,825.00

 Total 3.3 $2,617.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 2,617.00

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $2,617.00 $ 340.21

TOTAL TAXES 340.21

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 2,957.21  CAD
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THIS IS EXHIBIT "B" REFERRED TO IN THE 

AFFIDAVIT OF KENNETH KRAFT AFFIRMED 

BEFORE ME THIS 20th DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2021. 

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc. 
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3598406

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
June 30, 2021 584164-000002 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al.

Professional Fees $ 17,062.50

Disbursements 320.00

HST (13.0%) on $17,062.50 2,218.13

Total Amount Due                                               $ 19,600.63  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598406
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 5
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

01-Jun-21 SW Receipt of letter from accountant and emails regarding same. Emails 
regarding APS. Instructions to Fabian Abele.

0.3

01-Jun-21 KK Purchase agreement follow up matters. 0.1

02-Jun-21 KK Email updates. 0.1

03-Jun-21 SW Receipt and review of revised AVO and email regarding same.  Emails 
regarding AVO.

0.4

03-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding purchase agreement and 
related matters. Emailing with Daniel Kumer regarding closing agenda 
and related matters.

0.1

03-Jun-21 KK Various email exchanges related to purchase agreement on vesting 
orders.

0.1

04-Jun-21 SW Review and respond to email from Fabian Abele regarding vesting 
order. Review emails regarding vesting orders.

0.2

04-Jun-21 FA Reviewing research regarding vesting order matters. Emailing with 
Sara-Ann Wilson regarding vesting order matters. Emailing with Daniel 
Kumer regarding vesting order matters.

0.1

04-Jun-21 KK Transaction related emails. 0.1

07-Jun-21 SW Review vesting order and instructions regarding same.  Consider 
vesting orders.  Draft notice of motion.  Review and revise fee affidavit.

1.3

08-Jun-21 SW Review pre-closing conditions and emails from and to Fabian Abele 
regarding same.  Revise notice of motion and instructions regarding fee 
affidavit.  Revise administrative order. Review closing agenda and email 
regarding same. Revise vesting order. Email to Friedmans.

0.9

08-Jun-21 FA Drafting Closing Agenda. Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding 
closing agenda matters. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding closing 
agenda matters.

0.4

08-Jun-21 KK Emails. Review revisions to draft vesting order. 0.1

09-Jun-21 SW Email from Daniel Kumar regarding closing agenda. Instructions 
regarding second report. Review emails regarding costs. Draft second 
report.

2.6

09-Jun-21 KK Exchanges on projected costs and remaining matters. 0.1

10-Jun-21 SW Draft confidential appendix and instructions regarding same. 
Instructions regarding confidential appendix.

0.8

11-Jun-21 KK Working on sale approval motion material. 0.1

13-Jun-21 KK Working on sale approval motion materials. 0.1

14-Jun-21 SW Instructions regarding fee affidavit and emails regarding same.  Email 
regarding vesting order. Commission fee affidavit and instructions 
regarding updating report.  Email draft report to Zeifmans. Review 

1.0
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598406
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 3 of 5
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

Date ID Description of Work Hours

revisions to report and instructions. Review motion record index. 
Emails regarding property taxes. Emails regarding security review.  
Receipt and review of comments on draft report.  Receipt and review 
of vesting order comments.  Call to Daniel Kumar regarding vesting 
order.  Revise Second Report and email to Receiver.

14-Jun-21 KK Working on sale approval motion material and related email 
exchanges. Meet with Sara-Ann Wilson to commission affidavit.

0.2

15-Jun-21 SW Finalize Second Report. Receipt and review of R&D and fee affidavit. 
Receipt of signature page to report.  Instructions regarding service. 
Review final motion records and service email.  Emails regarding 
property taxes and clean up costs.  Finalize administrative orders.

0.8

15-Jun-21 KK Review and finalize motion material. 0.1

16-Jun-21 SW Emails regarding closing date.  Emails regarding vesting orders.  Review 
and respond to email from Fabian Abele regarding clean up costs.

0.3

16-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding closing timing and related 
matters. Reviewing question regarding municipal tax matters and 
remediation on property. Emailing summary of results to Sara-Ann 
Wilson.

0.2

16-Jun-21 KK Emails related to closing date extension. 0.1

17-Jun-21 SW Review emails regarding closing documents. Revise vesting order, 
review blackline and email to Friedmans.  Emails regarding closing 
arrangements. Emails regarding property taxes.

0.6

17-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding closing and related matters. 
Emailing with Daniel Kumer regarding closing document and related 
matters.

0.1

18-Jun-21 FA Emails regarding tax search and related matters. Providing instructions 
to Zehan Jagosh regarding statement of adjustments drafting.

0.1

21-Jun-21 SW Review comments on vesting order and revise. Finalize vesting orders. 
Receipt and review of closing documents. Emails regarding closing 
documents.

1.0

21-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding closing document matters. 
Emailing with Daniel Kumer regarding closing document matters.

0.1

21-Jun-21 KK Various transaction related emails. 0.1

22-Jun-21 SW Circulate revised vesting orders and emails regarding same. Emails to 
and from Ken Kraft regarding motion.

0.3

22-Jun-21 KK Email exchanges on various closing points and on prep for Thursday's 
hearing.

0.1

23-Jun-21 SW Instructions regarding draft orders and review same.  Emails regarding 
court hearing.  Emails regarding closing documents.  Review and 
respond to email from Stephen Nadler regarding fees.

0.5

23-Jun-21 FA Reviewing closing documents and comments received from Buyers' 
lawyers. Drafting Statement of Adjustments. Emailing Daniel Kumer 
regarding Statement of Adjustments matters.

0.7

23-Jun-21 KK Emails related to tomorrow's hearing and to close transaction. 0.1
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598406
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 4 of 5
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

Date ID Description of Work Hours

24-Jun-21 SW Emails regarding statement of adjustments. Prepare for vesting order 
motion. Review statement of adjustments. Attend motion for vesting 
orders.  Discussion with Ken Kraft regarding vesting order motions. 
Review revised statement of adjustments and emails. Emails to and 
from Allan Rutman regarding motion. Receipt and review of 
endorsement and orders and instructions and email regarding same.

1.7

24-Jun-21 FA Emails regarding Statement of Adjustments and closing document 
matters. Updating Statement of Adjustments. Further updating 
Statement of Adjustments. Emailing with Roman Konovalov regarding 
realty tax arrears matters. Finalizing updated closing documents. 
Drafting additional closing documents. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding 
closing document matters. Emailing Lopa Raulino regarding instructions 
for review of draft Application for Vesting Order.

1.0

24-Jun-21 KK Various emails related to today's hearing and various closing matters. 
Follow up discussion with Sara-Ann Wilson on issues. Review 
endorsement from hearing. Update email exchanges with Greg 
Marchant.

0.3

25-Jun-21 SW Emails regarding closing documents and payment of realty taxes. 
Instructions regarding order and endorsement. Emails regarding timing 
of closing. Review revised closing documents.

1.0

25-Jun-21 LR Review of email instructions from Fabian Abele. Review of procedures 
and electronic form of Application For Vesting Order.  Attend to 
provide comments on same, suggest pre-approval by Land Registry 
Office and forward email to Fabian Abele.

0.3

25-Jun-21 FA Emailing Sara-Ann Wilson regarding statement of adjustments, 
receiver's certificate and related matters. Reviewing application for 
vesting order. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding application for vesting 
order matters.

0.2

25-Jun-21 KK Closing related emails and updates. 0.1

28-Jun-21 SW Review emails regarding closing arrangements. Email to Fabian Abele 
regarding closing documents and review responding email.

0.2

28-Jun-21 FA Providing instructions to Zehan Jagosh regarding realty tax arrears 
summary sheet. Reviewing and updating realty tax arrears summary 
sheet. Drafting receivers certificates. Reviewing Applications for Vesting 
Order. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding closing and closing document 
matters. Emailing Allan Rutman regarding document execution and tax 
arrears matters.

0.8

28-Jun-21 KK Emails on various closing amounts and distributions. 0.1

29-Jun-21 SW Various emails and instructions regarding closing arrangements. Review 
receiver’s certificates and emails regarding same.  Review email 
regarding demolition costs.  Review revised receiver’s certificates. 
Emails regarding wire instructions.

0.6

29-Jun-21 FA Updating closing documents. Preparing materials for execution by Allan 
Rutman. Finalizing flow funds matters. Providing instructions to Crystal 
Zheng regarding wiring matters. Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson 
regarding receivers certificates and closing matters. Numerous emails 

0.7
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598406
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 5 of 5
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

Date ID Description of Work Hours

with Daniel Kumer in preparation for closing.

29-Jun-21 KK Various emails on issues for closing tomorrow and payment logistics. 0.1

30-Jun-21 SW Various emails regarding closing. Receipt of executed closing 
documents.  Consider closing extension and instructions regarding 
same.

0.4

30-Jun-21 FA Preparing for Closing of transaction. Numerous emails related to 
closing matters. Finalizing closing documents for circulation. Reviewing 
Purchaser's signed materials. Planning for flow of funds matters. Emails 
related to extension of closing. Calculating extension fee and related 
matters.

0.8

30-Jun-21 FA Preparing for Closing of transaction. Numerous emails related to 
closing matters. Finalizing closing documents for circulation. Reviewing 
Purchaser's signed materials. Planning for flow of funds matters. Emails 
related to extension of closing. Calculating extension fee and related 
matters.

0.8

30-Jun-21 KK Addressing various closing delay issues, extension terms and related 
emails.

0.1

 Total 23.5

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees

Fabian Abele 6.1 640.00 3,904.00

Kenneth Kraft 2.2 990.00 2,178.00

Lopa Raulino 0.3 345.00 103.50
Sara-Ann Wilson 14.9 730.00 10,877.00

 Total 23.5 $17,062.50

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 17,062.50

NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Filing Fee* $ 320.00
TOTAL NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 320.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 320.00

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 17,382.50

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $17,062.50 $ 2,218.13

TOTAL TAXES 2,218.13

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 19,600.63  CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3606533

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
July 31, 2021 584164-000002 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al.

Professional Fees $ 13,972.00

Disbursements 230.25

HST (13.0%) on $14,202.25 1,846.29

Total Amount Due                                               $ 16,048.54  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606533
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 5
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

02-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding closing funds. 0.2

02-Jul-21 FA Updating Statement of Adjustments. Emailing with Allan Rutman 
regarding closing and Statement of Adjustments matters. Emailing with 
Daniel Kumer regarding flow funds and closing matters.

0.3

02-Jul-21 KK Updated emails on closing adjustments. 0.1

05-Jul-21 SW Various emails regarding closing arrangements and receipt of funds. 
Emails regarding wire transfers. Emails regarding closing and 
distributions. Instructions regarding court availability. Emails regarding 
receiver’s certificates and cheques. Emails regarding security opinion. 
Emails regarding closing books and instructions regarding same.

0.6

05-Jul-21 FA Attending to closing of transaction. Managing flow of funds matters. 
Various emails regarding closing and related matters. Preparing record 
book materials. Finalizing receivers certificates.

0.9

05-Jul-21 KK Closing related emails. Exchanges related to Waverly invoice. Emails on 
moving forward with distribution issues.

0.2

06-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding scheduling distribution motion.  Instructions regarding 
closing books and sending to independent counsel. Consider 
distribution materials. Emails regarding filing certificates and emails to 
Friedmans regarding same.  Receipt and review of costs endorsement 
and email to receiver. Review email from court and instructions to 
Amanda Campbell.  Draft notice of motion for distribution motion.

1.1

06-Jul-21 KK Review costs endorsement and update emails. 0.1

07-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding booking distribution motion and instructions to 
Amanda Campbell regarding same. Consider relief at motion.

0.2

08-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding security review.  Emails regarding call to discuss next 
steps.  Email to Greg Marchant regarding distribution motion. Continue 
drafting notice of motion.  Various emails regarding parcel registers and 
review same.  Instructions to Amanda Campbell regarding motion 
record and fee affidavits. Draft Third Report.

1.7

08-Jul-21 FA Emailing Sara-Ann Wilson regarding construction lien discharge 
matters. Reviewing parcel abstracts in respect of construction lien 
discharge matters. Additional emails with Daniel Kumer regarding 
updated parcel abstracts.

0.2

08-Jul-21 KK Emails on distribution and other remaining issues. 0.1

09-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding searches and review same. Continue drafting Third 
Report. Instructions to Amanda Campbell regarding forwarding 
searches to independent counsel. Review and revise fee affidavit.

1.2

09-Jul-21 LLN Ordering and obtaining 3 Ontario Profile reports, 3 Ontario Personal 
Property Security act searches. Ordering 3 Ontario Personal Property 
Security act certificates.

0.7
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606533
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 3 of 5
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

Date ID Description of Work Hours

12-Jul-21 RA Receive and review instructions from Sara-Ann Wilson. Ordering Bank 
Act and OWL searches. Reviewing same. Correspondence regarding 
same.

0.2

12-Jul-21 SW Request execution and bank act searches and emails regarding real 
property opinion. Receipt and review of searches and forward to 
Rachelle Moncur.

0.3

13-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding call. Call with Greg Marchant and Receiver regarding 
distribution and next steps.

0.2

13-Jul-21 KK Review enforceability opinion from independent counsel on personal 
property security. Conference call with Greg Marchant, Allan Rutman, 
Roman Konovalov, and Sara-Ann Wilson on remaining steps and 
distribution issues.

0.3

18-Jul-21 KK Review CRA audit notices and deemed trust claims. 0.1

19-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding HST liability.  Review HST audit letters and consider 
HST priorities. Review ETA regarding HST priorities.  Call to Rachelle 
Moncur. Emails regarding service list. Call with receiver regarding 
motion. message to Rachelle Moncur.

0.9

19-Jul-21 KK Email exchanges on HST priority issues. Follow up on outstanding 
matters. Discussion with Allan Rutman, Roman Konovalov, and Sara-
Ann Wilson on distribution motion issues.

0.4

20-Jul-21 SW Review and revise motion record.  Consider distribution mechanics. 
Revise notice of motion. Continue drafting third report. Review and 
respond to emails regarding intercompany loan information.

0.8

20-Jul-21 ZJ Drafting closing record book for Fabian Abele 2.2

20-Jul-21 KK Review draft real estate enforceability opinion. Email exchanges on 
request to provide access to records.

0.1

21-Jul-21 SW Call with Rachelle Moncur.  Revise and update Third Report. 
Instructions regarding revising materials and updating appendices. 
Emails to and from Ken Kraft regarding distribution motion and 
consider same

0.8

21-Jul-21 KK Emails related to proposed distribution order. 0.1

22-Jul-21 SW Revise notice of motion. review loan agreements regarding lender’s 
fees.

0.4

22-Jul-21 KK Update emails. Review final versions of opinions on validity and 
enforceability of real property security.

0.1

23-Jul-21 SW Review real estate opinions and emails regarding same.  Message to 
Rachelle Moncur regarding motion.  Revise Third Report. Consider 
timing of service and emails regarding same.

0.8

23-Jul-21 KK Emails related to legal opinions and enforceability and distributions to 
lenders and on fee affidavits.

0.1

26-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding fee affidavits and supplemental report. Instructions to 
Amanda Campbell regarding reports and fee affidavit. Message to 
Rachelle Moncur regarding fee affidavit . Draft Supplemental Report. 
Emails to Greg Marchant regarding intercompany debts and loan 
amounts. Review and revise court materials.  Email to Receiver. Review 

0.8
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606533
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 4 of 5
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

Date ID Description of Work Hours

email regarding Crystal Hotel and responding email to Receiver.  
Discussion with Roman Konovalov.

26-Jul-21 KK Various emails related to issues to be addressed in motion materials 
and outstanding matters.

0.2

27-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding call with receiver. call with receiver regarding 
potential discharge and outstanding items. Revise Third Report and 
forward to Ken Kraft. Review email from Ken Kraft to Greg Marchant. 
Messages to Rachelle Moncur.

0.8

27-Jul-21 KK Emails. Discussion with Allan Rutman, Roman Konovalov and Sara-Ann 
Wilson to consider issues. Start to review draft report.

0.4

28-Jul-21 SW Receipt and review of updated loan amounts and lender listing. 
Instructions to Amanda Campbell.  Revise notice of motion. Draft 
orders. Email draft materials to Ken Kraft. Review appendices and 
instructions regarding same.  Draft orders. Emails to and from Ken Kraft 
regarding draft materials and revise same.

1.1

28-Jul-21 KK Working on motion material and related email exchanges. 0.4

29-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding finalizing distribution materials.  Discussion with 
Rachelle Moncur regarding distribution materials.  Revise and finalize 
materials and instructions regarding service.  Emails regarding motion 
records and review final materials.

0.7

29-Jul-21 KK Emails on motion material and revisions to materials. 0.2

30-Jul-21 SW Email from Steven Nadler and emails regarding indebtedness amounts. 0.1

30-Jul-21 KK Email exchanges related to information requested as to calculations of 
loan amounts.

0.1

 Total 20.2

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees

Fabian Abele 1.4 640.00 896.00

Kenneth Kraft 3.0 990.00 2,970.00

Lorie Neilson 0.7 310.00 217.00

Rennie Ali 0.2 230.00 46.00
Sara-Ann Wilson 12.7 730.00 9,271.00

Zehan Jagosh 2.2 260.00 572.00

 Total 20.2 $13,972.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 13,972.00

TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Searches $ 230.25
TOTAL TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 230.25

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 230.25

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 14,202.25
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606533
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 5 of 5
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $13,972.00 $ 1,816.36

HST (13.0%) on Taxable Disbursements of $230.25 29.93

TOTAL TAXES 1,846.29

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 16,048.54  CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3611028

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
August 31, 2021 584164-000002 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al.

Professional Fees $ 4,379.00

Disbursements 320.00

HST (13.0%) on $4,379.00 569.27

Total Amount Due                                               $ 5,268.27  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3611028
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 3
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

04-Aug-21 SW Review email from Steven Nadler and email to Greg Marchant 
regarding same. Emails to and from Receiver regarding email from 
Stephen Nadler. Receipt and review of invoices from Greg Marchant.  
Review and finalize draft orders. Emails regarding Caselines.

0.4

04-Aug-21 KK Emails related to further information requests. 0.1

05-Aug-21 SW Receipt of receiver’s invoices. Email to Stephen Nadler.  Emails to and 
from Rachelle Moncur regarding draft order and Caselines.

0.2

05-Aug-21 KK Various emails. 0.1

06-Aug-21 SW Instructions regarding counsel slip and review same. 0.1

06-Aug-21 SW Instructions regarding counsel slip and review same. 0.1

08-Aug-21 SW Emails to and from Rachelle Moncur regarding distribution motion. 0.1

10-Aug-21 SW Review and respond to email from Steven Nadler. Email to Ken Kraft. 0.1

10-Aug-21 KK Emails. Voice mails for Stephen Nadler. Review materials for 
tomorrow's motion.

0.2

11-Aug-21 SW Emails regarding distribution motion and revised orders.  Receipt and 
review of endorsement and orders.

0.2

12-Aug-21 SW Emails regarding issuing orders and service of same.  Review draft 
distribution from receiver.

0.2

12-Aug-21 KK Email exchanges regarding issued and entered orders and on finalizing 
interim distribution arrangements.

0.2

16-Aug-21 KK Email exchanges with Allan Rutman and consider impact on 
receivership of pursuing litigation related claims for recovery of 
amounts transferred to related companies.

0.1

17-Aug-21 SW Review and respond to email from Allan Rutman and emails regarding 
distribution.  Review fee affidavit.

0.1

17-Aug-21 KK Telephone call with Allan Rutman to discuss issues. 0.1

18-Aug-21 KK Telephone call with Allan Rutman and Jeremy Sacks to discuss 
receivership and pursuit of receivables owed to debtors.

0.1

23-Aug-21 SW Review emails regarding distributions. 0.1

23-Aug-21 KK Emails exchanged with Greg Marchant and Allan Rutman related to 
Agent's request for update note to explain distributions.

0.1

24-Aug-21 SW Draft email to lenders and email to Ken Kraft. Review responding email. 0.1

25-Aug-21 SW Instructions to Amanda Campbell regarding discharge materials. 
Review and revise draft discharge order.  Draft discharge notice of 
motion.  Instructions regarding fee affidavit.

0.9

26-Aug-21 SW Review and revise draft discharge orders. Draft Fourth Report. Review 
and respond to email from Ken Kraft regarding discharge motion.  
Emails regarding bankruptcy application.

1.1
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3611028
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 3 of 3
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

Date ID Description of Work Hours

26-Aug-21 KK Emails exchanged related to bankruptcy and discharge of Receiver. 
Revise draft update note to lenders on distributions from Receiver.

0.2

27-Aug-21 SW Review email from Ken Kraft regarding communication to lenders. 
Review and revise draft communication to lenders and email to Allan 
Rutman. Review emails regarding email to lenders.  Email draft email to 
Greg Marchant. Revise email to lenders and resend.

0.2

27-Aug-21 KK Further emails to finalize notice to lenders from Receiver/Agent 
regarding distributions.

0.1

30-Aug-21 SW Emails regarding booking court time for discharge motion.  Instructions 
to Amanda Campbell regarding request form.  Emails regarding funding 
for bankruptcy.  Revise discharge notice of motion.  Instructions 
regarding zoom invite.

0.2

30-Aug-21 KK Discharge application related emails. 0.1

 Total 5.5

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees

Kenneth Kraft 1.4 990.00 1,386.00

Sara-Ann Wilson 4.1 730.00 2,993.00

 Total 5.5 $4,379.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 4,379.00

NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Filing Fee* $ 320.00

TOTAL NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 320.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 320.00

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 4,699.00

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $4,379.00 $ 569.27

TOTAL TAXES 569.27

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 5,268.27  CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3614851

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
September 15, 2021 584164-000002 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al.

Professional Fees $ 855.00

HST (13.0%) on $855.00 111.15

Total Amount Due                                               $ 966.15  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3614851
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 2
Re: 4267 River Road LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000002

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

01-Sep-21 SW Emails regarding bankruptcy funding. Revise discharge notice of 
motion.

0.2

10-Sep-21 SW Revise and update discharge materials. Review fee affidavit. Email draft 
materials to Ken Kraft.

0.6

10-Sep-21 KK Email exchanges on discharge related materials and issues. 0.1

15-Sep-21 SW Review and respond to emails regarding fee affidavit. 0.1

15-Sep-21 KK Working on discharge motion material. 0.1

 Total 1.1

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees

Kenneth Kraft 0.2 990.00 198.00
Sara-Ann Wilson 0.9 730.00 657.00

 Total 1.1 $855.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 855.00

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $855.00 $ 111.15

TOTAL TAXES 111.15

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 966.15  CAD
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THIS IS EXHIBIT "C" REFERRED TO IN THE 

AFFIDAVIT OF KENNETH KRAFT AFFIRMED 

BEFORE ME THIS 20th DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2021. 

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc. 
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3598407

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
June 30, 2021 584164-000003 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al.

Professional Fees $ 16,550.50

Disbursements 320.00

HST (13.0%) on $16,550.50 2,151.57

Total Amount Due                                               $ 19,022.07  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598407
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 5
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

01-Jun-21 SW Receipt of letter from accountant and emails regarding same. Emails 
regarding APS. Instructions to Fabian Abele.

0.3

01-Jun-21 KK Purchase agreement follow up matters. 0.1

02-Jun-21 KK Email updates. 0.1

03-Jun-21 SW Receipt and review of revised AVO and email regarding same.  Emails 
regarding AVO.

0.4

03-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding purchase agreement and 
related matters. Emailing with Daniel Kumer regarding closing agenda 
and related matters.

0.1

03-Jun-21 KK Various email exchanges related to purchase agreement on vesting 
orders.

0.1

04-Jun-21 SW Review and respond to email from Fabian Abele regarding vesting 
order. Review emails regarding vesting orders.

0.2

04-Jun-21 FA Reviewing research regarding vesting order matters. Emailing with 
Sara-Ann Wilson regarding vesting order matters. Emailing with Daniel 
Kumer regarding vesting order matters.

0.1

04-Jun-21 KK Transaction related emails. 0.1

07-Jun-21 SW Review vesting order and instructions regarding same.  Consider 
vesting orders.  Draft notice of motion.  Review and revise fee affidavit.

1.3

08-Jun-21 SW Review pre-closing conditions and emails from and to Fabian Abele 
regarding same.  Revise notice of motion and instructions regarding fee 
affidavit.  Revise administrative order. Review closing agenda and email 
regarding same. Revise vesting order. Email to Friedmans.

0.9

08-Jun-21 FA Drafting Closing Agenda. Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding 
closing agenda matters. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding closing 
agenda matters.

0.4

08-Jun-21 KK Emails. Review revisions to draft vesting order. 0.1

09-Jun-21 SW Email from Daniel Kumar regarding closing agenda. Instructions 
regarding second report. Review emails regarding costs. Draft second 
report.

2.6

09-Jun-21 KK Exchanges on projected costs and remaining matters. 0.1

10-Jun-21 SW Draft confidential appendix and instructions regarding same. 
Instructions regarding confidential appendix.

0.8

11-Jun-21 KK Working on sale approval motion material. 0.1

13-Jun-21 KK Working on sale approval motion materials. 0.1

14-Jun-21 SW Instructions regarding fee affidavit and emails regarding same.  Email 
regarding vesting order. Commission fee affidavit and instructions 
regarding updating report.  Email draft report to Zeifmans. Review 

1.0
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598407
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 3 of 5
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

Date ID Description of Work Hours

revisions to report and instructions. Review motion record index. 
Emails regarding property taxes. Emails regarding security review.  
Receipt and review of comments on draft report.  Receipt and review 
of vesting order comments.  Call to Daniel Kumar regarding vesting 
order.  Revise Second Report and email to Receiver.

14-Jun-21 KK Working on sale approval motion material and related email 
exchanges. Meet with Sara-Ann Wilson to commission affidavit.

0.2

15-Jun-21 SW Finalize Second Report. Receipt and review of R&D and fee affidavit. 
Receipt of signature page to report.  Instructions regarding service. 
Review final motion records and service email.  Emails regarding 
property taxes and clean up costs.  Finalize administrative orders.

0.8

15-Jun-21 KK Review and finalize motion material. 0.1

16-Jun-21 SW Emails regarding closing date.  Emails regarding vesting orders.  Review 
and respond to email from Fabian Abele regarding clean up costs.

0.3

16-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding closing timing and related 
matters. Reviewing question regarding municipal tax matters and 
remediation on property. Emailing summary of results to Sara-Ann 
Wilson.

0.2

16-Jun-21 KK Emails related to closing date extension. 0.1

17-Jun-21 SW Review emails regarding closing documents. Revise vesting order, 
review blackline and email to Friedmans.  Emails regarding closing 
arrangements. Emails regarding property taxes.

0.6

17-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding closing and related matters. 
Emailing with Daniel Kumer regarding closing document and related 
matters.

0.1

18-Jun-21 FA Emails regarding tax search and related matters. Providing instructions 
to Zehan Jagosh regarding statement of adjustments drafting.

0.1

21-Jun-21 SW Review comments on vesting order and revise. Finalize vesting orders. 
Receipt and review of closing documents. Emails regarding closing 
documents.

1.0

21-Jun-21 FA Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson regarding closing document matters. 
Emailing with Daniel Kumer regarding closing document matters.

0.1

21-Jun-21 KK Various transaction related emails. 0.1

22-Jun-21 SW Circulate revised vesting orders and emails regarding same. Emails to 
and from Ken Kraft regarding motion.

0.3

22-Jun-21 KK Email exchanges on various closing points and on prep for Thursday's 
hearing.

0.1

23-Jun-21 SW Instructions regarding draft orders and review same.  Emails regarding 
court hearing.  Emails regarding closing documents.  Review and 
respond to email from Stephen Nadler regarding fees.

0.5

23-Jun-21 FA Reviewing closing documents and comments received from Buyers' 
lawyers. Drafting Statement of Adjustments. Emailing Daniel Kumer 
regarding Statement of Adjustments matters.

0.7

23-Jun-21 KK Emails related to tomorrow's hearing and to close transaction. 0.1
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598407
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 4 of 5
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

Date ID Description of Work Hours

24-Jun-21 SW Emails regarding statement of adjustments. Prepare for vesting order 
motion. Review statement of adjustments. Attend motion for vesting 
orders.  Discussion with Ken Kraft regarding vesting order motions. 
Review revised statement of adjustments and emails. Emails to and 
from Allan Rutman regarding motion. Receipt and review of 
endorsement and orders and instructions and email regarding same.

1.7

24-Jun-21 FA Emails regarding Statement of Adjustments and closing document 
matters. Updating Statement of Adjustments. Further updating 
Statement of Adjustments. Emailing with Roman Konovalov regarding 
realty tax arrears matters. Finalizing updated closing documents. 
Drafting additional closing documents. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding 
closing document matters. Emailing Lopa Raulino regarding instructions 
for review of draft Application for Vesting Order.

1.0

24-Jun-21 KK Various emails related to today's hearing and various closing matters. 
Follow up discussion with Sara-Ann Wilson on issues. Review 
endorsement from hearing. Update email exchanges with Greg 
Marchant.

0.3

25-Jun-21 SW Emails regarding closing documents and payment of realty taxes. 
Instructions regarding order and endorsement. Emails regarding timing 
of closing. Review revised closing documents.

1.0

25-Jun-21 LR Review of email instructions from Fabian Abele. Review of procedures 
and electronic form of Application For Vesting Order.  Attend to 
provide comments on same, suggest pre-approval by Land Registry 
Office and forward email to Fabian Abele.

0.3

25-Jun-21 FA Emailing Sara-Ann Wilson regarding statement of adjustments, 
receiver's certificate and related matters. Reviewing application for 
vesting order. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding application for vesting 
order matters.

0.2

25-Jun-21 KK Closing related emails and updates. 0.1

28-Jun-21 SW Review emails regarding closing arrangements. Email to Fabian Abele 
regarding closing documents and review responding email.

0.2

28-Jun-21 FA Providing instructions to Zehan Jagosh regarding realty tax arrears 
summary sheet. Reviewing and updating realty tax arrears summary 
sheet. Drafting receivers certificates. Reviewing Applications for Vesting 
Order. Emailing Daniel Kumer regarding closing and closing document 
matters. Emailing Allan Rutman regarding document execution and tax 
arrears matters.

0.8

28-Jun-21 KK Emails on various closing amounts and distributions. 0.1

29-Jun-21 SW Various emails and instructions regarding closing arrangements. Review 
receiver’s certificates and emails regarding same.  Review email 
regarding demolition costs.  Review revised receiver’s certificates. 
Emails regarding wire instructions.

0.6

29-Jun-21 FA Updating closing documents. Preparing materials for execution by Allan 
Rutman. Finalizing flow funds matters. Providing instructions to Crystal 
Zheng regarding wiring matters. Emailing with Sara-Ann Wilson 
regarding receivers certificates and closing matters. Numerous emails 

0.7

DocuSign Envelope ID: 2382F534-C1A5-4F14-ADA0-154193FA8211

247



DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3598407
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 5 of 5
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

Date ID Description of Work Hours

with Daniel Kumer in preparation for closing.

29-Jun-21 KK Various emails on issues for closing tomorrow and payment logistics. 0.1

30-Jun-21 SW Various emails regarding closing. Receipt of executed closing 
documents.  Consider closing extension and instructions regarding 
same.

0.4

30-Jun-21 FA Preparing for Closing of transaction. Numerous emails related to 
closing matters. Finalizing closing documents for circulation. Reviewing
Purchaser's signed materials. Planning for flow of funds matters. Emails 
related to extension of closing. Calculating extension fee and related 
matters.

0.8

30-Jun-21 KK Addressing various closing delay issues, extension terms and related 
emails.

0.1

 Total 22.7

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Fabian Abele 5.3 640.00 3,392.00

Kenneth Kraft 2.2 990.00 2,178.00

Lopa Raulino 0.3 345.00 103.50

Sara-Ann Wilson 14.9 730.00 10,877.00

 Total 22.7 $16,550.50

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 16,550.50

NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Filing Fee* $ 320.00

TOTAL NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 320.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 320.00

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 16,870.50

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $16,550.50 $ 2,151.57

TOTAL TAXES 2,151.57

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 19,022.07  CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3606534

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
July 31, 2021 584164-000003 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al.

Professional Fees $ 13,991.00

Disbursements 573.58

HST (13.0%) on $14,564.58 1,893.40

Total Amount Due                                               $ 16,457.98  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606534
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 5
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

02-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding closing funds. 0.2

02-Jul-21 FA Updating Statement of Adjustments. Emailing with Allan Rutman 
regarding closing and Statement of Adjustments matters. Emailing with 
Daniel Kumer regarding flow funds and closing matters.

0.3

02-Jul-21 KK Updated emails on closing adjustments. 0.1

05-Jul-21 SW Various emails regarding closing arrangements and receipt of funds. 
Emails regarding wire transfers. Emails regarding closing and 
distributions. Instructions regarding court availability. Emails regarding 
receiver’s certificates and cheques. Emails regarding security opinion. 
Emails regarding closing books and instructions regarding same.

0.6

05-Jul-21 FA Attending to closing of transaction. Managing flow of funds matters. 
Various emails regarding closing and related matters. Preparing record 
book materials. Finalizing receivers certificates.

0.9

05-Jul-21 KK Closing related emails. Emails on moving forward with distribution 
issues.

0.1

06-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding scheduling distribution motion.  Instructions regarding 
closing books and sending to independent counsel. Consider 
distribution materials. Emails regarding filing certificates and emails to 
Friedmans regarding same.  Receipt and review of costs endorsement 
and email to receiver. Review email from court and instructions to 
Amanda Campbell.  Draft notice of motion for distribution motion.

1.1

06-Jul-21 KK Review costs endorsement and update emails. 0.1

07-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding booking distribution motion and instructions to 
Amanda Campbell regarding same. Consider relief at motion.

0.2

08-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding security review.  Emails regarding call to discuss next 
steps.  Email to Greg Marchant regarding distribution motion. Continue 
drafting notice of motion.  Various emails regarding parcel registers and 
review same.  Instructions to Amanda Campbell regarding motion 
record and fee affidavits. Draft Third Report.

1.7

08-Jul-21 FA Emailing Sara-Ann Wilson regarding construction lien discharge 
matters. Reviewing parcel abstracts in respect of construction lien 
discharge matters. Additional emails with Daniel Kumer regarding 
updated parcel abstracts.

0.2

08-Jul-21 KK Emails on distribution and other remaining issues. 0.1

09-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding searches and review same. Continue drafting Third 
Report. Instructions to Amanda Campbell regarding forwarding 
searches to independent counsel. Review and revise fee affidavit.

1.2

09-Jul-21 LLN Ordering and obtaining 2 Ontario Profile reports, 1 Ontario Limited 
Partnership report, 3 Ontario Personal Property Security act searches. 
Ordering 3 Ontario Personal Property Security act certificates.

0.7
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606534
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 3 of 5
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

Date ID Description of Work Hours

09-Jul-21 LLN Ordering and obtaining 2 Ontario Profile reports, 1 Ontario Limited 
Partnership report, 3 Ontario Personal Property Security act searches. 
Ordering 3 Ontario Personal Property Security act certificates.

0.7

12-Jul-21 RA Receive and review instructions from Sara-Ann Wilson. Ordering Bank 
Act and OWL searches. Reviewing same. Correspondence regarding 
same.

0.2

12-Jul-21 SW Request execution and bank act searches and emails regarding real 
property opinion. Receipt and review of searches and forward to 
Rachelle Moncur.

0.3

13-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding call. Call with Greg Marchant and Receiver regarding 
distribution and next steps.

0.2

13-Jul-21 KK Review enforceability opinion from independent counsel on personal 
property security. Conference call with Greg Marchant, Allan Rutman, 
Roman Konovalov, and Sara-Ann Wilson on remaining steps and 
distribution issues.

0.3

19-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding HST liability.  Review HST audit letters and consider 
HST priorities. Review ETA regarding HST priorities.  Call to Rachelle 
Moncur. Emails regarding service list. Call with receiver regarding 
motion. message to Rachelle Moncur.

0.9

19-Jul-21 KK Email exchanges on HST priority issues. Follow up on outstanding 
matters. Discussion with Allan Rutman, Roman Konovalov, and Sara-
Ann Wilson on distribution motion issues.

0.4

20-Jul-21 SW Review and revise motion record.  Consider distribution mechanics. 
Revise notice of motion. Continue drafting third report. Review and 
respond to emails regarding intercompany loan information.

0.8

20-Jul-21 KK Review draft real estate enforceability opinion. Email exchanges on 
request to provide access to records.

0.1

21-Jul-21 SW Call with Rachelle Moncur.  Revise and update Third Report. 
Instructions regarding revising materials and updating appendices. 
Emails to and from Ken Kraft regarding distribution motion and 
consider same

0.8

21-Jul-21 ZJ Drafting closing record book for Fabian Abele Read email from Abele, 
Fabian: Zeifman \\Marchant - Record book Composed email to Abele, 
Fabian: RE: Zeifman \\Marchant - Record book

2.2

21-Jul-21 KK Emails related to proposed distribution order. 0.1

22-Jul-21 SW Revise notice of motion. review loan agreements regarding lender’s 
fees.

0.4

22-Jul-21 KK Update emails. Review final versions of opinions on validity and 
enforceability of real property security.

0.1

23-Jul-21 SW Review real estate opinions and emails regarding same.  Message to 
Rachelle Moncur regarding motion.  Revise Third Report. Consider 
timing of service and emails regarding same.

0.8

23-Jul-21 KK Emails related to legal opinions and enforceability and distributions to 
lenders and on fee affidavits.

0.1
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606534
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 4 of 5
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

Date ID Description of Work Hours

26-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding fee affidavits and supplemental report. Instructions to 
Amanda Campbell regarding reports and fee affidavit. Message to 
Rachelle Moncur regarding fee affidavit . Draft Supplemental Report. 
Emails to Greg Marchant regarding intercompany debts and loan 
amounts. Review and revise court materials.  Email to Receiver. Review 
email regarding Crystal Hotel and responding email to Receiver.  
Discussion with Roman Konovalov.

0.8

26-Jul-21 KK Various emails related to issues to be addressed in motion materials 
and outstanding matters.

0.2

27-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding call with receiver. call with receiver regarding 
potential discharge and outstanding items. Revise Third Report and 
forward to Ken Kraft. Review email from Ken Kraft to Greg Marchant. 
Messages to Rachelle Moncur.

0.8

27-Jul-21 KK Emails. Discussion with Allan Rutman, Roman Konovalov and Sara-Ann 
Wilson to consider issues. Start to review draft report.

0.4

28-Jul-21 SW Receipt and review of updated loan amounts and lender listing. 
Instructions to Amanda Campbell.  Revise notice of motion. Draft 
orders. Email draft materials to Ken Kraft. Review appendices and 
instructions regarding same.  Draft orders. Emails to and from Ken Kraft 
regarding draft materials and revise same.

1.1

28-Jul-21 KK Working on motion material and related email exchanges. 0.4

29-Jul-21 SW Emails regarding finalizing distribution materials.  Discussion with 
Rachelle Moncur regarding distribution materials.  Revise and finalize 
materials and instructions regarding service.  Emails regarding motion 
records and review final materials.

0.7

29-Jul-21 KK Emails on motion material and revisions to materials. 0.2

30-Jul-21 SW Email from Steven Nadler and emails regarding indebtedness amounts. 0.1

30-Jul-21 KK Email exchanges related to information requested as to calculations of 
loan amounts.

0.1

 Total 20.7

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees

Fabian Abele 1.4 640.00 896.00
Kenneth Kraft 2.8 990.00 2,772.00

Lorie Neilson 1.4 310.00 434.00

Rennie Ali 0.2 230.00 46.00

Sara-Ann Wilson 12.7 730.00 9,271.00

Zehan Jagosh 2.2 260.00 572.00

 Total 20.7 $13,991.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 13,991.00

TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Searches $ 573.58
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3606534
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 5 of 5
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

TOTAL TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 573.58

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 573.58

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 14,564.58

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $13,991.00 $ 1,818.83

HST (13.0%) on Taxable Disbursements of $573.58 74.57

TOTAL TAXES 1,893.40

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 16,457.98  CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3611029

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
August 31, 2021 584164-000003 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al.

Professional Fees $ 4,306.00

Disbursements 320.00

HST (13.0%) on $4,306.00 559.78

Total Amount Due                                               $ 5,185.78  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3611029
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 3
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

04-Aug-21 SW Review email from Steven Nadler and email to Greg Marchant 
regarding same. Emails to and from Receiver regarding email from 
Stephen Nadler. Receipt and review of invoices from Greg Marchant.  
Review and finalize draft orders. Emails regarding Caselines.

0.4

04-Aug-21 KK Emails related to further information requests. 0.1

05-Aug-21 SW Receipt of receiver’s invoices. Email to Stephen Nadler.  Emails to and 
from Rachelle Moncur regarding draft order and Caselines.

0.2

05-Aug-21 KK Various emails. 0.1

06-Aug-21 SW Instructions regarding counsel slip and review same. 0.1

08-Aug-21 SW Emails to and from Rachelle Moncur regarding distribution motion. 0.1

10-Aug-21 SW Review and respond to email from Steven Nadler. Email to Ken Kraft. 0.1

10-Aug-21 KK Emails. Voice mails for Stephen Nadler. Review materials for 
tomorrow's motion.

0.2

11-Aug-21 SW Emails regarding distribution motion and revised orders.  Receipt and 
review of endorsement and orders.

0.2

12-Aug-21 SW Emails regarding issuing orders and service of same.  Review draft 
distribution from receiver.

0.2

12-Aug-21 KK Email exchanges regarding issued and entered orders and on finalizing 
interim distribution arrangements.

0.2

16-Aug-21 KK Email exchanges with Allan Rutman and consider impact on 
receivership of pursuing litigation related claims for recovery of 
amounts transferred to related companies.

0.1

17-Aug-21 SW Review and respond to email from Allan Rutman and emails regarding 
distribution.  Review fee affidavit.

0.1

17-Aug-21 KK Telephone call with Allan Rutman to discuss issues. 0.1

18-Aug-21 KK Telephone call with Allan Rutman and Jeremy Sacks to discuss 
receivership and pursuit of receivables owed to debtors.

0.1

23-Aug-21 SW Review emails regarding distributions. 0.1

23-Aug-21 KK Emails exchanged with Greg Marchant and Allan Rutman related to 
Agent's request for update note to explain distributions.

0.1

24-Aug-21 SW Draft email to lenders and email to Ken Kraft. Review responding email. 0.1

25-Aug-21 SW Instructions to Amanda Campbell regarding discharge materials. 
Review and revise draft discharge order.  Draft discharge notice of 
motion.  Instructions regarding fee affidavit.

0.9

26-Aug-21 SW Review and revise draft discharge orders. Draft Fourth Report. Review 
and respond to email from Ken Kraft regarding discharge motion.  
Emails regarding bankruptcy application.

1.1

26-Aug-21 KK Emails exchanged related to bankruptcy and discharge of Receiver. 0.2
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3611029
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 3 of 3
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

Date ID Description of Work Hours

Revise draft update note to lenders on distributions from Receiver.

27-Aug-21 SW Review email from Ken Kraft regarding communication to lenders. 
Review and revise draft communication to lenders and email to Allan 
Rutman. Review emails regarding email to lenders.  Email draft email to 
Greg Marchant. Revise email to lenders and resend.

0.2

27-Aug-21 KK Further emails to finalize notice to lenders from Receiver/Agent 
regarding distributions.

0.1

30-Aug-21 SW Emails regarding booking court time for discharge motion.  Instructions 
to Amanda Campbell regarding request form.  Emails regarding funding 
for bankruptcy.  Revise discharge notice of motion.  Instructions 
regarding zoom invite.

0.2

30-Aug-21 KK Discharge application related emails. 0.1

 Total 5.4

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees
Kenneth Kraft 1.4 990.00 1,386.00

Sara-Ann Wilson 4.0 730.00 2,920.00

 Total 5.4 $4,306.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 4,306.00

NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS

Filing Fee* $ 320.00
TOTAL NON-TAXABLE DISBURSEMENTS $ 320.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 320.00

TOTAL FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS $ 4,626.00

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $4,306.00 $ 559.78

TOTAL TAXES 559.78

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 5,185.78  CAD
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Dentons Canada LLP
77 King Street West, Suite 400

Toronto-Dominion Centre
Toronto, ON, Canada  M5K 0A1

T 416 863 4511
F 416 863 4592

dentons.com

Zeifman Partners Inc.
201 Bridgeland Avenue
Toronto ON M6A 1Y7

INVOICE # 3614852

GST/HST # R121996078
QST # 1086862448 TQ 0001

Attention:  Allan Rutman
 

Date Matter Number Lawyer
September 15, 2021 584164-000003 Kenneth Kraft

Zeifman Partners Inc.
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al.

Professional Fees $ 855.00

HST (13.0%) on $855.00 111.15

Total Amount Due                                               $ 966.15  CAD

DENTONS CANADA LLP

Per:  _______________________________
Kenneth Kraft

Payment Options:

Cheques:
Cheques payable to Dentons Canada LLP
and mailed to the above noted address.

Internet Banking:
Accepted at most financial institutions.  Your payee is Dentons Canada LLP and 
your account number is 584164.  Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com
referencing invoice number and payment amount.

Wire Transfer:
Bank of Montreal
1st Canadian Place, Toronto, ON
Swift Code:  BOFMCAM2
Bank ID:  001 Transit: 00022
CAD Funds Bank Account : 0004-324

Interac e-Transfer:
e-Transfer funds to AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number in 
message. Please use matter number referenced on your invoice as the password. 
Alternatively, send password to AR.Canada@dentons.com in separate email.

Credit Card:
Payments are accepted via telephone, email or fax.  We accept American Express, MasterCard or Visa (please circle one).
Card No. ________________________________________ Expiry Date:   Card Verification Code (CVC): ___________
Amount:   Cardholder Name: ________________________________________________________________
Signature:  ___________________________________________________________________________________________________

Please email us at AR.Canada@dentons.com referencing invoice number and payment amount.
Payment due on receipt.  Interest will be charged at the rate of 1.3% per annum on all outstanding amounts over 30 days.
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DENTONS CANADA LLP INVOICE 3614852
Zeifman Partners Inc. Page 2 of 2
Re: 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP, et al. Matter # 584164-000003

Invoice Detail

TO PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with the above noted matter:

Date ID Description of Work Hours

01-Sep-21 SW Emails regarding bankruptcy funding. Revise discharge notice of 
motion.

0.2

10-Sep-21 SW Revise and update discharge materials. Review fee affidavit. Email draft 
materials to Ken Kraft.

0.6

10-Sep-21 KK Email exchanges on discharge related materials and issues. 0.1

15-Sep-21 SW Review and respond to emails regarding fee affidavit. 0.1

15-Sep-21 KK Working on discharge motion material. 0.1

 Total 1.1

Timekeeper Hours Rate Fees

Kenneth Kraft 0.2 990.00 198.00
Sara-Ann Wilson 0.9 730.00 657.00

 Total 1.1 $855.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 855.00

TAXES

HST (13.0%) on Professional Fees of $855.00 $ 111.15

TOTAL TAXES 111.15

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $ 966.15  CAD
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THIS IS EXHIBIT "D" REFERRED TO IN THE 

AFFIDAVIT OF KENNETH KRAFT AFFIRMED 

BEFORE ME THIS 20th DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2021. 

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc. 
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THIS IS EXHIBIT "E" REFERRED TO IN THE 

AFFIDAVIT OF KENNETH KRAFT AFFIRMED 

BEFORE ME THIS 20th DAY OF  SEPTEMBER, 2021. 

A Commissioner for Taking Affidavits, etc. 
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EXHIBIT “E” 

Billing Rates of Dentons Canada LLP 

For the period June 1, 2020 to September 15, 2021 

2021 Standard 
Rate 

Year of Call 

Kenneth Kraft $990 1991 

Sara-Ann Wilson $730 2008 

Fabian Abele $620 2014 

Zehan Jagosh $260 Summer Law Student 

Lopa Raulino $345 Land Conveyancer 

Lorie Neilson $310 Corporate Searcher 

Rennie Ali $230 Law Clerk 
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Appendix “P” 

to the Fourth Report of the Receiver 
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Appendix “Q” 

to the Fourth Report of the Receiver 
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Tab 3



Court File No.: CV-18-00604717-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

THE HONOURABLE  

JUSTICE CAVANAGH 

)

)

) 

TUESDAY, THE 5th 

DAY OF OCTOBER, 2021

B E T W E E N: 

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent 

Applicant 

- and - 

2407553 ONTARIO INC., 2384648 ONTARIO INC., 2384646 ONTARIO INC., 2400196 
ONTARIO INC. and 2396139 ONTARIO INC. 

Respondents

DISCHARGE ORDER  

THIS MOTION, made by Zeifman Partners Inc. (“Zeifman”) in its capacity as the 

Court-appointed receiver (the “Receiver”) of the assets, undertakings and properties of 2407553 

Ontario Inc., 2384648 Ontario Inc., 2384646 Ontario Inc., 2400196 Ontario Inc., and 2396139 

Ontario Inc. (collectively, the “Debtors”), for an order:  

1. approving the Fourth Report of the Receiver, dated September 23, 2021 (the “Fourth 

Report”), and the activities of the Receiver described therein;  

2. approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel;  

3. approving the Receiver’s statement of receipts and disbursements, for the period from 

October 14, 2020, to September 20, 2021 (the “R&D”); 
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4. authorizing the Receiver to pay a retainer to the trustee to fund the administration of the 

bankrupt Debtors’ estates; 

5. approving the distribution of the remaining proceeds available in the estate of the 

Debtors;   

6. discharging Zeifman as Receiver of the assets, undertakings and properties of the 

Debtors; and 

7. releasing Zeifman from any and all liability, as set out in paragraph 8 of this Order, 

was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario via videoconference.  

ON READING the Fourth Report, the Affidavits of Kenneth Kraft, affirmed September 

20, 2021, Allan Rutman, affirmed September 20, 2021, Rachelle Moncur, sworn September 18, 

2021, and Norman Winter, affirmed August 18, 2021 (the “Fee Affidavits”), and on hearing the 

submissions of counsel for the Receiver and any other party appearing;   

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Fourth Report and the activities of the Receiver as 

described therein are hereby approved.   

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its 

counsel, plus the estimates as to fees and expenses up to the effective date of the Receiver’s 

discharge, as set out in the Fourth Report and the Fee Affidavits, are hereby approved. 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver’s R&D is hereby approved. 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is hereby authorized, upon the appointment 

of the trustee in bankruptcy in respect of the estates of the Debtors, to pay $19,000 per estate to 

the trustee to fund the administration of the bankruptcies. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that, after payment of the fees, disbursements and retainer 

herein approved, the Receiver shall distribute the monies remaining in its hands as follows: 

(a) pay the expenses of the Applicant; and 
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(b) after payment of the Applicant’s expenses, distribute the remaining monies in its 

hands to the lenders listed in Appendix “A” attached hereto in accordance with 

their respective loan percentages.  

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the payments permitted under paragraph 5(a) are without 

prejudice to the ability of the Respondents, and their principals, to challenge the propriety of any 

of the Applicant’s expenses. 

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that upon payment of the amounts set out in paragraph 5 

hereof and upon the Receiver filing a certificate, in the form attached hereto as Appendix “B”, 

certifying that it has completed the other activities described in the Fourth Report, the Receiver 

shall be discharged as Receiver of the assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtors, 

provided however that notwithstanding its discharge herein (a) the Receiver shall remain 

Receiver for the performance of such incidental duties as may be required to complete the 

administration of the receivership herein, and (b) the Receiver shall continue to have the benefit 

of the provisions of all Orders made in this proceeding, including all approvals, protections and 

stays of proceedings in favour of Zeifman in its capacity as Receiver. 

8. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that Zeifman is hereby released and 

discharged from any and all liability that Zeifman now has or may hereafter have by reason of, or 

in any way arising out of, the acts or omissions of Zeifman while acting in its capacity as 

Receiver herein, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the Receiver's 

part.  Without limiting the generality of the foregoing, Zeifman is hereby forever released and 

discharged from any and all liability relating to matters that were raised, or which could have 

been raised, in the within receivership proceedings, save and except for any gross negligence or 

wilful misconduct on the Receiver's part.

_______________________________________ 

291



Appendix “A” 

Lender Original Loan 
Amount

Percentage of Loan 
SRnED Limited (Earl Viner) 100,000.00 1.4286%

Lakes Holdings Ltd. (Earl Viner) 350,000.00 5.0000%

Marni Feingold (Earl Viner's niece) 50,000.00 0.7143%

Marjan Misiurak Holdings Inc. 100,000.00 1.4286%

JLL Developments Inc. 200,000.00 2.8571%

Susanna and Sheldon Kwok 300,000.00 4.2857%

Stephen Kwok Professional Corporation 350,000.00 5.0000%

Hilary and Lan Ma 200,000.00 2.8571%

Mark and Julia Wong 200,000.00 2.8571%

Edith Lau 50,000.00 0.7143%

ESTS Incorporated (Wilma Ieong) 100,000.00 1.4286%

Raymond Yeung 100,000.00 1.4286%

Dr. Ian Lo Dentistry Professional Corporation 100,000.00 1.4286%

995820 Ontario Inc. c/o Tammy Lee 100,000.00 1.4286%

2174912 Ontario Inc. c/o Michael Wong 200,000.00 2.8571%

Dr. William Chiu Dentistry Professional Corporation 300,000.00 4.2857%

Dr. Bryan Chan Dentistry Professional Corporation 150,000.00 2.1429%

Dr. Bernard Y.T. Li Medicine Professional Corporation 100,000.00 1.4286%

Dr. Wing K. Tse Medicine Professional Corporation 100,000.00 1.4286%

Dr. Dakin Lee Dentistry Professional Corporation 100,000.00 1.4286%

Dr. Hoppy Hui Dentistry Professional Corporation 150,000.00 2.1429%

Eddie Siek-Hin Leung 100,000.00 1.4286%

John Francis Footprints Limited 500,000.00 7.1429%

1862199 Ontario Inc.( ASO Sandie Murphy) 100,000.00 1.4286%

Frank DiMarco In Trust (formerly Alfredo & Maria DiMarco) 500,000.00 7.1429%

1599732 Ontario Limited( ASO: Randy Miller) 200,000.00 2.8571%

2083294 Ontario Inc. ( ASO: Antonio Baretto) 200,000.00 2.8571%

Michael Longo, Riccardo Carnevale, Daniele Carnevale 215,000.00 3.0714%

Riccardo Carnevale 130,000.00 1.8571%

Daniele Carnevale 125,000.00 1.7857%

Lindwall Holdings Inc. 270,000.00 3.8571%

2331144 Ontario Ltd (ASO: Beata Grygowski) 100,000.00 1.4286%

Leslaw and Danuta Wojtanowski 100,000.00 1.4286%

MLC Financial Ltd. (ASO: Mark Curtis) 100,000.00 1.4286%

Fox Realty Corp. 50,000.00 0.7143%

MCL Communications Ltd.(c/o Mr. Kim Lockhart) 200,000.00 2.8571%

Nadir Janmohammed 200,000.00 2.8571%

David Goncalves (formerly Walji) 200,000.00 2.8571%

Faiza Kassam and Nazir Kassam 75,000.00 1.0714%

Sabrina Kassam and Rizwan Mohamed 35,000.00 0.5000%

Karim Naser 100,000.00 1.4286%

Remco Holdings Inc 100,000.00 1.4286%

Total $ 7,000,000.00 100.0000%
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Appendix “B” 

Court File No.: CV-18-00604717-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST) 

B E T W E E N: 

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent 

Applicant 

- and - 

2407553 ONTARIO INC., 2384648 ONTARIO INC., 2384646 ONTARIO INC., 2400196 
ONTARIO INC. and 2396139 ONTARIO INC. 

Respondents

DISCHARGE CERTIFICATE  

RECITALS 

A. Pursuant to an Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the 

“Court”) dated August 6, 2020, Zeifman Partners Inc. (“Zeifman”) was appointed as receiver 

(the “Receiver”), of the assets, undertakings and properties of 2407553 Ontario inc., 2384648 

Ontario Inc., 2384646 Ontario Inc., 2400196 Ontario Inc., and 2396139 Ontario Inc. 

(collectively, the “Debtors”).  

B. Pursuant to an Order of the Court, dated , 2021 (the “Discharge Order”), Zeifman was 

discharged as Receiver of the Debtors, effective upon the Receiver filing a certificate with the 

Court confirming that it has completed the activities described in the Fourth Report of the 

Receiver, dated September 23, 2021 (the “Fourth Report”). 
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THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following: 

1. The Receiver has paid all amounts required to be paid pursuant to the Discharge Order; 

and 

2. The Receiver is satisfied that it has completed the other activities described in the Fourth 

Report.   

THIS CERTIFICATE is dated , 2021. 

ZEIFMAN PARTNERS INC., solely in its 
capacity as the court-appointed receiver of the 
Debtors, and not in its personal capacity or 
corporate capacity

Per: 

Name: 

Title:  
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Tab 4 



Court File No. CV-18-00604725-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST)    

THE HONOURABLE  

JUSTICE CAVANAGH 

)

)

) 

TUESDAY, THE 5th 

DAY OF OCTOBER, 2021

B E T W E E N:   

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

4267 RIVER ROAD LP and 4267 RIVER ROAD GP INC. 

Respondents

DISCHARGE ORDER  

THIS MOTION, made by Zeifman Partners Inc. (“Zeifman”) in its capacity as the 

Court-appointed receiver (the “Receiver”) of the assets, undertakings and properties of 4267 

River Road LP and 4267 River Road GP Inc. (together, the “Debtors”), for an order:  

1. approving the Fourth Report of the Receiver, dated September 23, 2021 (the “Fourth 

Report”), and the activities of the Receiver described therein;  

2. approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel;  

3. approving the Receiver’s statement of receipts and disbursements, for the period from 

October 14, 2020, to September 20, 2021 (the “R&D”); 

4. authorizing the Receiver to pay a retainer to the trustee to fund the administration of the 

bankrupt Debtors’ estates; 

5. approving the distribution of the remaining proceeds available in the estate of the 

Debtors;   
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6. discharging Zeifman as Receiver of the assets, undertakings and properties of the 

Debtors; and 

7. releasing Zeifman from any and all liability, as set out in paragraph 8 of this Order, 

was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario via videoconference.  

ON READING the Fourth Report, the Affidavits of Kenneth Kraft, affirmed September 

20, 2021, Allan Rutman, affirmed September 20, 2021, Rachelle Moncur, sworn September 18, 

2021, and Norman Winter, affirmed August 18, 2021 (the “Fee Affidavits”), and on hearing the 

submissions of counsel for the Receiver and any other party appearing;   

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Fourth Report and the activities of the Receiver as 

described therein are hereby approved.   

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its 

counsel, plus the estimates as to fees and expenses up to the effective date of the Receiver’s 

discharge, as set out in the Fourth Report and the Fee Affidavits, are hereby approved. 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver’s R&D is hereby approved. 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is hereby authorized, upon the appointment 

of the trustee in bankruptcy in respect of the estates of the Debtors, to pay $19,000 per estate to 

the trustee to fund the administration of the bankruptcies. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that, after payment of the fees, disbursements and retainer 

herein approved, the Receiver shall distribute the monies remaining in its hands as follows: 

(a) pay the expenses of the Applicant; and 

(b) after payment of the Applicant’s expenses, distribute the remaining monies in its 

hands to the lenders listed in Appendix “A” attached hereto in accordance with 

their respective loan percentages.  

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the payments permitted under paragraph 5(a) are without 

prejudice to the ability of the Respondents, and their principals, to challenge the propriety of any 

of the Applicant’s expenses. 
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7. THIS COURT ORDERS that upon payment of the amounts set out in paragraph 5 

hereof and upon the Receiver filing a certificate, in the form attached hereto as Appendix “B”, 

certifying that it has completed the other activities described in the Fourth Report, the Receiver 

shall be discharged as Receiver of the assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtors, 

provided however that notwithstanding its discharge herein (a) the Receiver shall remain 

Receiver for the performance of such incidental duties as may be required to complete the 

administration of the receivership herein, and (b) the Receiver shall continue to have the benefit 

of the provisions of all Orders made in this proceeding, including all approvals, protections and 

stays of proceedings in favour of Zeifman in its capacity as Receiver.  

8. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that Zeifman is hereby released and 

discharged from any and all liability that Zeifman now has or may hereafter have by reason of, or 

in any way arising out of, the acts or omissions of Zeifman while acting in its capacity as 

Receiver herein, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the Receiver's 

part.  Without limiting the generality of the foregoing, Zeifman is hereby forever released and 

discharged from any and all liability relating to matters that were raised, or which could have 

been raised, in the within receivership proceedings, save and except for any gross negligence or 

wilful misconduct on the Receiver's part. 

_______________________________________ 
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Appendix “A”

Lender Original Loan 
Amount

Percentage of Loan
Faiza & Nazir Kassam 200,000.00 6.7912%

485 Kingston Road Limited (Svetlana Dimitroff) 460,000.00 15.6197%
Dr. Svetlana Dimitroff 260,000.00 8.8285%

Daveni Investments Ltd. (Earl Viner) 200,000.00 6.7912%
Campana Consulting 100,000.00 3.3956%

Jack Shinehoft Professional Corporation 50,000.00 1.6978%
Senol & Fatima Tasdelin 300,000.00 10.1868%

Remco Holdings 25,000.00 0.8489%
Onally & Sofia Rahemtulla 75,000.00 2.5467%

Rose Consultants Limited (Bryan Pilutti) 200,000.00 6.7912%
Tony Lee 150,000.00 5.0934%
Willis Qu 150,000.00 5.0934%
Stephen & Susanna Kwok 100,000.00 3.3956%
1221455 Ontario Limited (Kwok) 100,000.00 3.3956%
Wilma Ieong Professional Corporation 100,000.00 3.3956%
Ditchburn Consulting Inc. (Tony Ditchburn) 75,000.00 2.5467%
Edith Lai Yuk Chiu 100,000.00 3.3956%
Mark & Julia Wong 100,000.00 3.3956%
Raymond Yeung 100,000.00 3.3956%
Dr Ian Lo Dentistry Professional Corporation 100,000.00 3.3956%

TOTAL $ $2,945,000.00 100.0000%
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Appendix “B” 

Court File No. CV-18-00604725-00CL 

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

(COMMERCIAL LIST)    

B E T W E E N:   

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

4267 RIVER ROAD LP and 4267 RIVER ROAD GP INC. 

Respondents

DISCHARGE CERTIFICATE 

RECITALS 

A. Pursuant to an Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the 

“Court”), dated August 6, 2020, Zeifman Partners Inc. (“Zeifman”) was appointed as receiver 

(the “Receiver”), of the assets, undertakings and properties of 4267 River Road LP and 4267 

River Road GP Inc. (collectively, the “Debtors”).  

B. Pursuant to an Order of the Court, dated , 2021 (the “Discharge Order”), Zeifman was 

discharged as Receiver of the Debtors, effective upon the Receiver filing a certificate with the 

Court confirming that it has completed the activities described in the Fourth Report of the 

Receiver, dated September 23, 2021 (the “Fourth Report”). 

THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following: 

1. The Receiver has paid all amounts required to be paid pursuant to the Discharge Order; 

and 
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2. The Receiver is satisfied that it has completed the other activities described in the Fourth 

Report.   

THIS CERTIFICATE is dated , 2021. 

ZEIFMAN PARTNERS INC., solely in its 
capacity as the court-appointed receiver of the 
Debtors, and not in its personal capacity or 
corporate capacity

Per: 

Name: 

Title:  
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Tab 5 



Court File No. CV-18-00604721-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

COMMERCIAL LIST    

THE HONOURABLE  

JUSTICE CAVANAGH 

)

)

) 

TUESDAY, THE 5th 

DAY OF OCTOBER, 2021

B E T W E E N:   

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE LP and 4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE GP INC. 

Respondents 

DISCHARGE ORDER  

THIS MOTION, made by Zeifman Partners Inc. (“Zeifman”) in its capacity as the 

Court-appointed receiver (the “Receiver”) of the assets, undertakings and properties of 4544 

Zimmerman Avenue LP and 4544 Zimmerman Avenue GP Inc. (together, the “Debtors”), for an 

order:  

1. approving the Fourth Report of the Receiver, dated September 23, 2021 (the “Fourth 

Report”), and the activities of the Receiver described therein;  

2. approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel;  

3. approving the Receiver’s statement of receipts and disbursements, for the period from 

October 14, 2020, to September 20, 2021 (the “R&D”); 

4. authorizing the Receiver to pay a retainer to the trustee to fund the administration of the 

bankrupt Debtors’ estates; 
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5. approving the distribution of the remaining proceeds available in the estate of the 

Debtors;   

6. discharging Zeifman as Receiver of the assets, undertakings and properties of the 

Debtors; and 

7. releasing Zeifman from any and all liability, as set out in paragraph 8 of this Order, 

was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario via videoconference.  

ON READING the Fourth Report, the Affidavits of Kenneth Kraft, affirmed September 

20, 2021, Allan Rutman, affirmed September 20, 2021, Rachelle Moncur, sworn September 18, 

2021, and Norman Winter, affirmed August 18, 2021 (the “Fee Affidavits”), and on hearing the 

submissions of counsel for the Receiver and any other party appearing;   

1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Fourth Report and the activities of the Receiver as 

described therein are hereby approved.   

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its 

counsel, plus the estimates as to fees and expenses up to the effective date of the Receiver’s 

discharge, as set out in the Fourth Report and the Fee Affidavits, are hereby approved. 

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver’s R&D is hereby approved. 

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is hereby authorized, upon the appointment 

of the trustee in bankruptcy in respect of the estates of the Debtors, to pay $19,000 per estate to 

the trustee to fund the administration of the bankruptcies. 

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that, after payment of the fees, disbursements and retainer 

herein approved, the Receiver shall distribute the monies remaining in its hands as follows: 

(a) pay the expenses of the Applicant; and 

(b) after payment of the Applicant’s expenses, distribute the remaining monies in its 

hands to the lenders listed in Appendix “A” attached hereto in accordance with 

their respective loan percentages.  
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6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the payments permitted under paragraph 5(a) are without 

prejudice to the ability of the Respondents, and their principals, to challenge the propriety of any 

of the Applicant’s expenses. 

7. THIS COURT ORDERS that upon payment of the amounts set out in paragraph 5 

hereof and upon the Receiver filing a certificate, in the form attached hereto as Appendix “B”, 

certifying that it has completed the other activities described in the Fourth Report, the Receiver 

shall be discharged as Receiver of the assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtors, 

provided however that notwithstanding its discharge herein (a) the Receiver shall remain 

Receiver for the performance of such incidental duties as may be required to complete the 

administration of the receivership herein, and (b) the Receiver shall continue to have the benefit 

of the provisions of all Orders made in this proceeding, including all approvals, protections and 

stays of proceedings in favour of Zeifman in its capacity as Receiver. 

8. THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that Zeifman is hereby released and 

discharged from any and all liability that Zeifman now has or may hereafter have by reason of, or 

in any way arising out of, the acts or omissions of Zeifman while acting in its capacity as 

Receiver herein, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the Receiver's 

part.  Without limiting the generality of the foregoing, Zeifman is hereby forever released and 

discharged from any and all liability relating to matters that were raised, or which could have 

been raised, in the within receivership proceedings, save and except for any gross negligence or 

wilful misconduct on the Receiver's part.

_______________________________________ 
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Appendix “A” 

Lender Original Loan Amount Percentage of Loan 
1862199 Ontario Inc.( ASO Sandie Murphy) 50,000.00 1.1111%

2083294 Ontario Inc. ( ASO: Antonio Barreto) 200,000.00 4.4444%

2174912 Ontario Inc. c/o Michael Wong 100,000.00 2.2222%

2331144 Ontario Ltd (ASO: Beata Grygowski) 100,000.00 2.2222%

995820 Ontario Inc. c/o Tammy Lee 100,000.00 2.2222%

REMCO HOLDINGS ONTARIO LTD 100,000.00 2.2222%

John Francis Footprints Limited (formerly Chelsea Francis Family Trust) 250,000.00 5.5556%

Daniele Carnevale 150,000.00 3.3333%

Dr. Bernard Y.T. Li Medicine Professional Corporation 100,000.00 2.2222%

Dr. Bryan Chan Dentistry Professional Corporation 50,000.00 1.1111%

Dr. Dakin Lee Dentistry Professional Corporation 100,000.00 2.2222%

Dr. Hoppy Hui Dentistry Professional Corporation 50,000.00 1.1111%

Dr. William Chiu Dentistry Professional Corporation 50,000.00 1.1111%

Ed Heakes 50,000.00 1.1111%

Eddie Siek-Hin Leung 150,000.00 3.3333%

Frank Geier 400,000.00 8.8889%

Frank Greco 125,000.00 2.7778%

Jack Shinehoft Professional Corp 100,000.00 2.2222%

James Greenwood 200,000.00 4.4444%

Karim Naser 100,000.00 2.2222%

John Francis Footprints Limited (formerly Kathryn Francis Family Trust) 250,000.00 5.5556%

Les Wojtanowski 50,000.00 1.1111%

Danuta Wojtanowski 50,000.00 1.1111%

Mark and Julia Wong 100,000.00 2.2222%

Michael Longo 100,000.00 2.2222%

Naveera Mahum 200,000.00 4.4444%

Peter Volpe 100,000.00 2.2222%

Riccardo Carnavale 150,000.00 3.3333%

SDA Services Group Inc (ASO Luis Leite) 250,000.00 5.5556%

Stephen Kwok Professional Corporation 200,000.00 4.4444%

Katherine Suedan (formerly Teresa DiMarco) 150,000.00 3.3333%

Tony Vella 25,000.00 0.5556%

Wendy Dixon Dejonge Trust 150,000.00 3.3333%

Wilma Ieong & Eric Sito 200,000.00 4.4444%

Total $ 4,500,000.00 100.0000%
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Appendix “B” 

Court File No. CV-18-00604721-00CL 

ONTARIO 
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE 

COMMERCIAL LIST    

B E T W E E N:   

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant 

- and - 

4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE LP and 4544 ZIMMERMAN AVENUE GP INC. 

Respondents 

DISCHARGE CERTIFICATE 

RECITALS 

A. Pursuant to an Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the 

“Court”) dated August 6, 2020, Zeifman Partners Inc. (“Zeifman”) was appointed as receiver 

(the “Receiver”), of the assets, undertakings and properties of 4544 Zimmerman Avenue LP and 

4544 Zimmerman Avenue GP Inc. (together, the “Debtors”).  

B. Pursuant to an Order of the Court, dated , 2021 (the “Discharge Order”), Zeifman was 

discharged as Receiver of the Debtors, effective upon the Receiver filing a certificate with the 

Court confirming that it has completed the activities described in the Fourth Report of the 

Receiver, dated September 23, 2021 (the “Fourth Report”). 

THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following: 

1. The Receiver has paid all amounts required to be paid pursuant to the Discharge Order; 

and 
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2. The Receiver is satisfied that it has completed the other activities described in the Fourth 

Report.   

THIS CERTIFICATE is dated , 2021. 

ZEIFMAN PARTNERS INC., solely in its 
capacity as the court-appointed receiver of the 
Debtors, and not in its personal capacity or 
corporate capacity

Per: 

Name: 

Title:  
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Tab 6 



Revised: May 11, 2010

DOCSTOR: 1201925\8

THE HONOURABLE      

JUSTICE      CAVANAGH

)

)

)

Court File No.      : CV-18-00604717-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

(COMMERCIAL LIST   )

WEEKDAYTUESDAY, THE #5th

DAY OF MONTHOCTOBER,

20YR2021

B E T W E E N:

PLAINTIFF

Plaintiff

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant

- and –-

DEFENDANT

Defendant

2407553 ONTARIO INC., 2384648 ONTARIO INC., 2384646 ONTARIO INC., 2400196
ONTARIO INC. and 2396139 ONTARIO INC.

Respondents

DISCHARGE ORDER

THIS MOTION, made by [RECEIVER'S NAME]Zeifman Partners Inc. (“Zeifman”) in

its capacity as the Court-appointed receiver (the "“Receiver"”) of the undertaking, property and

assets of [DEBTOR] (, undertakings and properties of 2407553 Ontario Inc., 2384648 Ontario

Inc., 2384646 Ontario Inc., 2400196 Ontario Inc., and 2396139 Ontario Inc. (collectively, the

"Debtor"“Debtors”), for an order:
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1. approving the activities of the Receiver as set out in the reportFourth Report of the

Receiver, dated [DATE]September 23, 2021 (the "“Fourth Report"”), and the activities of the

Receiver described therein;

2. approving the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its counsel;

3. approving the Receiver’s statement of receipts and disbursements, for the period from

October 14, 2020, to September 20, 2021 (the “R&D”);

4. authorizing the Receiver to pay a retainer to the trustee to fund the administration of the

bankrupt Debtors’ estates;

5. approving the distribution of the remaining proceeds available in the estate of the

DebtorDebtors; [and]

6. 4. discharging [RECEIVER'S NAME]Zeifman as Receiver of the undertaking, property

and assets, undertakings and properties of the Debtor[Debtors; and

7. 5. releasing [RECEIVER'S NAME]Zeifman from any and all liability, as set out in

paragraph 58 of this Order]1,

was heard this day at 330 University Avenue, Toronto, Ontario via videoconference.

ON READING the Fourth Report, the affidavits of the Receiver and its counsel as to

feesAffidavits of Kenneth Kraft, affirmed September 20, 2021, Allan Rutman, affirmed

September 20, 2021, Rachelle Moncur, sworn September 18, 2021, and Norman Winter,

affirmed August 18, 2021 (the "“Fee Affidavits"”), and on hearing the submissions of counsel

for the Receiver, no one else and any other party appearing although served as evidenced by the

Affidavit of [NAME] sworn [DATE], filed2;

1 If this relief is being sought, stakeholders should be specifically advised, and given ample notice.  See also Note 4,
below.

2 This model order assumes that the time for service does not need to be abridged.
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1. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Fourth Report and the activities of the Receiver, as set

out in the Report,described therein are hereby approved.

2. THIS COURT ORDERS that the fees and disbursements of the Receiver and its

counsel, plus the estimates as to fees and expenses up to the effective date of the Receiver’s

discharge, as set out in the Fourth Report and the Fee Affidavits, are hereby approved.

3. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver’s R&D is hereby approved.

4. THIS COURT ORDERS that the Receiver is hereby authorized, upon the appointment

of the trustee in bankruptcy in respect of the estates of the Debtors, to pay $19,000 per estate to

the trustee to fund the administration of the bankruptcies.

5. THIS COURT ORDERS that, after payment of the fees and, disbursements and retainer

herein approved, the Receiver shall distribute the monies remaining in its hands as follows:

(a) pay the moniesexpenses of the Applicant; and

(b) after payment of the Applicant’s expenses, distribute the remaining monies in its

hands to [NAME OF PARTY]3the lenders listed in Appendix “A” attached hereto

in accordance with their respective loan percentages.

6. THIS COURT ORDERS that the payments permitted under paragraph 5(a) are without

prejudice to the ability of the Respondents, and their principals, to challenge the propriety of any

of the Applicant’s expenses.

7. 4. THIS COURT ORDERS that upon payment of the amounts set out in paragraph 35

hereof [and upon the Receiver filing a certificate, in the form attached hereto as Appendix “B”,

certifying that it has completed the other activities described in the Fourth Report], the Receiver

shall be discharged as Receiver of the undertaking, property and assets, undertakings and

properties of the DebtorDebtors, provided however that notwithstanding its discharge herein (a)

the Receiver shall remain Receiver for the performance of such incidental duties as may be

3 This model order assumes that the material filed supports a distribution to a specific secured creditor or other
party.
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required to complete the administration of the receivership herein, and (b) the Receiver shall

continue to have the benefit of the provisions of all Orders made in this proceeding, including all

approvals, protections and stays of proceedings in favour of [RECEIVER'S NAME]Zeifman in

its capacity as Receiver.

8. 5. [THIS COURT ORDERS AND DECLARES that [RECEIVER'S NAME]Zeifman

is hereby released and discharged from any and all liability that [RECEIVER'S

NAME]Zeifman now has or may hereafter have by reason of, or in any way arising out of, the

acts or omissions of [RECEIVER'S NAME]Zeifman while acting in its capacity as Receiver

herein, save and except for any gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the Receiver's part.

Without limiting the generality of the foregoing, [RECEIVER'S NAME]Zeifman is hereby

forever released and discharged from any and all liability relating to matters that were raised, or

which could have been raised, in the within receivership proceedings, save and except for any

gross negligence or wilful misconduct on the Receiver's part.]4

_______________________________________

4 The model order subcommittee was divided as to whether a general release might be appropriate.  On the one
hand, the Receiver has presumably reported its activities to the Court, and presumably the reported activities have
been approved in prior Orders.  Moreover, the Order that appointed the Receiver likely has protections in favour of
the Receiver.  These factors tend to indicate that a general release of the Receiver is not necessary.  On the other
hand, the Receiver has acted only in a representative capacity, as the Court's officer, so the Court may find that it is
appropriate to insulate the Receiver from all liability, by way of a general release.  Some members of the
subcommittee felt that, absent a general release, Receivers might hold back funds and/or wish to conduct a claims
bar process, which would unnecessarily add time and cost to the receivership.  The general release language has
been added to this form of model order as an option only, to be considered by the presiding Judge in each specific
case.  See also Note 1, above.
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0.7143%

Lakes Holdings Ltd. (Earl Viner)

100,000.00 1.4286%

JLL Developments Inc.

ESTS Incorporated (Wilma Ieong)

John Francis Footprints Limited

Percentage of Loan

500,000.00 7.1429%

100,000.00

1862199 Ontario Inc.( ASO Sandie Murphy)

1.4286%

200,000.00

100,000.00 1.4286%

Raymond Yeung

Frank DiMarco In Trust (formerly Alfredo & Maria DiMarco)

2.8571%

500,000.00

350,000.00

7.1429%

100,000.00

1599732 Ontario Limited( ASO: Randy Miller)

1.4286%

200,000.00 2.8571%

Susanna and Sheldon Kwok

Dr. Ian Lo Dentistry Professional Corporation

2083294 Ontario Inc. ( ASO: Antonio Baretto)

5.0000%

200,000.00 2.8571%

100,000.00

Lender

Michael Longo, Riccardo Carnevale, Daniele Carnevale

1.4286%

300,000.00

215,000.00 3.0714%

995820 Ontario Inc. c/o Tammy Lee

Riccardo Carnevale

4.2857%

130,000.00

SRnED Limited (Earl Viner)

1.8571%

100,000.00

Daniele Carnevale

1.4286%

Marni Feingold (Earl Viner's niece)

125,000.00 1.7857%

Stephen Kwok Professional Corporation

2174912 Ontario Inc. c/o Michael Wong

Lindwall Holdings Inc. 270,000.00 3.8571%

200,000.00

2331144 Ontario Ltd (ASO: Beata Grygowski)

2.8571%

350,000.00

100,000.00 1.4286%

Dr. William Chiu Dentistry Professional Corporation

Leslaw and Danuta Wojtanowski

5.0000%

100,000.00

50,000.00

1.4286%

300,000.00

MLC Financial Ltd. (ASO: Mark Curtis)

4.2857%

100,000.00 1.4286%

Hilary and Lan Ma

Dr. Bryan Chan Dentistry Professional Corporation

Fox Realty Corp.

0.7143%

50,000.00 0.7143%

150,000.00

100,000.00

MCL Communications Ltd.(c/o Mr. Kim Lockhart)

2.1429%

200,000.00

200,000.00 2.8571%

Dr. Bernard Y.T. Li Medicine Professional Corporation

Nadir Janmohammed

2.8571%

200,000.00

Appendix “A”

2.8571%

100,000.00

David Goncalves (formerly Walji)

1.4286%

Marjan Misiurak Holdings Inc.

200,000.00 2.8571%

Mark and Julia Wong

Dr. Wing K. Tse Medicine Professional Corporation

Faiza Kassam and Nazir Kassam

1.4286%

75,000.00 1.0714%

100,000.00

Sabrina Kassam and Rizwan Mohamed

1.4286%

200,000.00

35,000.00 0.5000%

Original Loan

Dr. Dakin Lee Dentistry Professional Corporation

Karim Naser

2.8571%

100,000.00

100,000.00

1.4286%

100,000.00

Remco Holdings Inc

1.4286%

100,000.00 1.4286%

Edith Lau

Dr. Hoppy Hui Dentistry Professional Corporation

1.4286%

150,000.00

Total

2.1429%

$

50,000.00

7,000,000.00 100.0000%

Eddie Siek-Hin Leung
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Appendix “B”

Court File No.: CV-18-00604717-00CL

ONTARIO
SUPERIOR COURT OF JUSTICE

(COMMERCIAL LIST)

B E T W E E N:

MARCHANT REALTY PARTNERS INC., as agent

Applicant

- and -

2407553 ONTARIO INC., 2384648 ONTARIO INC., 2384646 ONTARIO INC., 2400196
ONTARIO INC. and 2396139 ONTARIO INC.

Respondents

DISCHARGE CERTIFICATE

RECITALS

A. Pursuant to an Order of the Ontario Superior Court of Justice (Commercial List) (the

“Court”) dated August 6, 2020, Zeifman Partners Inc. (“Zeifman”) was appointed as receiver

(the “Receiver”), of the assets, undertakings and properties of 2407553 Ontario inc., 2384648

Ontario Inc., 2384646 Ontario Inc., 2400196 Ontario Inc., and 2396139 Ontario Inc.

(collectively, the “Debtors”).

B. Pursuant to an Order of the Court, dated , 2021 (the “Discharge Order”), Zeifman was

discharged as Receiver of the Debtors, effective upon the Receiver filing a certificate with the

Court confirming that it has completed the activities described in the Fourth Report of the

Receiver, dated September 23, 2021 (the “Fourth Report”).

DOCSTOR: 1201925\8
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-2-

ZEIFMAN PARTNERS INC., solely in its
capacity as the court-appointed receiver of the
Debtors, and not in its personal capacity or
corporate capacity

Name:

Per:

THE RECEIVER CERTIFIES the following:

1. The Receiver has paid all amounts required to be paid pursuant to the Discharge Order;

and

2. The Receiver is satisfied that it has completed the other activities described in the Fourth

Report.

THIS CERTIFICATE is dated , 2021.

Title:
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